Group 05600 Award 23092 & 23215

Notes:

GASOLINE & E-85 PRICES

Publication Date =

Start Date =
End Date =

Group 05600

Awards 23237
4/29/2024
4/26/2024
5/2/2024

1) All prices are taken from the OPIS Weekly Published Newsletter published on Mondays.

2) All prices are per gallon.

3) The volume discount applies to deliveries 5,500 gallons or greater.
4) Extension of Award 23092 is in blue. Expired 3/18/2022

Gasoline Pricing Valid From: 4/26/2024 Through 5/2/2024
County Fuel Type Current Price Volume Discount Vendor Contract
Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.1283 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Albany Gas Regular $2.8777 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Gas Mid Range $3.0969 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Alleaan Gas Regular No Bid N/A N/A No Award
gany Gas Mid Range No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Bronx OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.9301 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Broome Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Gas Regular $2.9752 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC69519
Cattarauaus Gas Regular $2.9187 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
9 Gas Mid Range $3.2042 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
Cayuga Gas Regular $3.2152 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Chautaudua Gas Regular $2.9822 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
a Gas Mid Range  $3.2042 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel ~ PC69517
Gas Premium $3.5417 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Chemun Gas Regular $3.0252 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC69519
g Gas Mid Range $3.2802 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC69519
Gas Premium $3.6777 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC69519
Chenango Gas Regular $3.1697 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Clinton Gas Regular $3.0552 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC69520
Gas Mid Range $3.2802 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC69520
Columbia Gas Regular $3.0033 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Cortland Gas Regular $3.1902 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Gas Premium $3.7572 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Delaware Gas Regular $3.3252 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC69519
Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.1538 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Dutchess OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.9335 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range $3.0343 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
OPRG (E) Gas Premium $3.1749 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Erie Gas Regular $2.8402 $0.0100 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
Gas Mid Range $3.2112 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
Cocox Gas Regular $3.0252 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC69520
Gas Mid Range $3.2502 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC69520
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Franklin Gas Regular $3.0352 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC69520
Gas Premium $3.5977 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC69520
Fulton Gas Regular $2.8947 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Gas Mid Range $3.1302 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Genesee Gas Regular $2.9707 $0.0000 Sunoco LP PC69523
Greene Gas Regular $3.0022 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Gas Premium $3.5462 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Herkimer Gas Regular $3.0467 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Gas Premium $3.6277 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Jefferson Gas Regular $3.1827 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Gas Mid Range $3.5202 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Kinas OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.9069 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
9 OPRG (E) Gas Premium $3.1382 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
Livinaston Gas Regular $3.0402 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC69521
g Gas Mid Range $3.3452 $0.0100 NOCO Energy PC69521
Madison Gas Regular $2.9800 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Gas Mid Range $3.4107 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Monroe Gas Regular $2.8707 $0.0000 Sunoco LP PC69523
Gas Mid Range $3.1407 $0.0000 Sunoco LP PC69523
Gas Premium $3.4782 $0.0000 Sunoco LP PC69523
Montaomer Gas Regular $2.8675 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
gomery Gas Mid Range  $3.1202 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.1413 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Nassau OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.7436 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range $2.8593 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
OPRG (E) Gas Premium $2.9749 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
New York OPRG (E) Gas Premium $3.3710 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Gas Regular $2.8737 $0.0100 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
Niagara Gas Mid Range $3.2042 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
Gas Premium $3.5467 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
Oneida Gas Regular $3.0465 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Gas Mid Range $3.3681 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
onondaga Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
g Gas Regular $3.0652 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC69519
Gas Regular No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Ontario Gas Mid Range No Bid N/A N/A No Award
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Group 05600 Award 23092 & 23215

Gasoline Pricing Valid From: 4/26/2024 Through 5/2/2024
| Gas Premium No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.1564 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Orange OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.9361 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
g OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range $3.0369 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
OPRG (E) Gas Premium $3.1175 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Orleans Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Gas Regular $2.9002 $0.0500 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Oswego Gas Regular $3.0647 $0.0650 NOCO Energy PC69521
Gas Mid Range $3.2897 $0.0650 NOCO Energy PC69521
Otsego | Gas Regular $2.9942 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.9299 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Putnam OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range $3.0307 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
OPRG (E) Gas Premium $3.1713 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.7938 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
Queens OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range $2.9095 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
OPRG (E) Gas Premium $3.0251 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.1259 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Rensselaer Gas Regular $2.9003 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Gas Mid Range $3.1095 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Richmond | OPRG (E) Gas Regular No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.1441 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Rockland OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.9238 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range $3.0246 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
OPRG (E) Gas Premium $3.1652 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Gas Regular $2.9466 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Saratoga Gas Mid Range $3.1658 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Gas Premium $3.5506 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Gas Regular $2.9498 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Schenectady .
Gas Mid Range $3.1090 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Schoharie | Gas Regular $2.9402 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Schuyler | Gas Regular $3.1167 $0.0000 Sunoco LP PC69523
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Seneca Gas Regular $3.2697 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Gas Mid Range $3.5152 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Gas Premium $3.8577 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
St Lawrence Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
' Gas Regular $3.0852 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC69520
Steuben Gas Regular $3.0967 $0.0000 Sunoco LP PC69523
Gas Mid Range $3.3417 $0.0000 Sunoco LP PC69523
Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.1242 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
Suffolk OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.7498 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range $2.8655 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
OPRG (E) Gas Premium $2.9811 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
Sullivan | Gas Regular $2.9781 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Tioga | Gas Regular $3.2752 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC69519
Tompkins | Gas Regular $3.0147 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC69515
Gas Regular $2.9383 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Ulster Gas Mid Range $3.1475 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Gas Premium $3.5023 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Warren Gas Regular $2.9300 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Gas Mid Range $3.1392 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Washinaton Gas Regular $2.9902 $0.0000 Main Brothers Oil PC69518
g Gas Mid Range $3.2302 $0.0000 Main Brothers Oil PC69518
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Wayne Gas Regular $3.0267 $0.0000 Sunoco LP PC69523
Gas Mid Range $3.2717 $0.0000 Sunoco LP PC69523
Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.1552 $0.0000 Global Montello PC69516
Westchester OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.8276 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range $2.9433 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
OPRG (E) Gas Premium $3.0589 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC69522
Wyoming | Gas Regular $2.9822 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC69517
vates Gas Regular No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Gas Mid Range No Bid N/A N/A No Award
GASOLINE PRICE CALCULATIONS
Notes:
1) All prices are taken from the OPIS Weekly Published Newsletter published on Mondays.
2) All prices are per gallon.
3) The volume discount applies to deliveries 5,500 gallons or greater.
Current Gas Regular
Reg Unl = $2.6952 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
Base Price = $2.1702 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
Adjustment = $0.5250 dollars per gallon
Current Gas Mid Range
Mid Unl = $2.9202 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
Base Price = $2.2480 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
Adjustment = $0.6722 dollars per gallon
Current Gas Premium
Pre Unl = $3.2577 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
Base Price = $2.3647 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
Adjustment = $0.8930 dollars per gallon
Current OPRG (E) Gas Regular
RBOB = $2.7412 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, NY Harbor Barge
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Group 05600 Award 23092 & 23215

Gasoline Pricing Valid From: 4/26/2024 Through 5/2/2024
Ethanol = $1.7755 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, NY Spot Market Price!
Current Price = $2.6445 dollars per gallon
Base Price = $2.2251 dollars per gallon
Adjustment = $0.4194 dollars per gallon

Current OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range

Average of RBOB & PreRBOB = $2.8697 dollars per gallon
Ethanol = $1.7755 dollars per gallon

Current Price = $2.7602 dollars per gallon

Base Price = $2.2859 dollars per gallon

Adjustment = $0.4743 dollars per gallon

Current OPRG (E) Gas Premium

Current Flex Fuel (E-85)

PreRBOB = $2.9982 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, NY Harbor Barge
Ethanol = $1.7755 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, NY Spot Market Price!
Current Price = $2.8758 dollars per gallon
Base Price = $2.3467 dollars per gallon
Adjustment = $0.5291 dollars per gallon
Gas Regular $2.6952 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
Ethanol = $1.7755 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, NY Spot Market Price:
Current Price = $1.9133 dollars per gallon
Base Price = $2.3306 dollars per gallon
Adjustment = -$0.4173 dollars per gallon
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Group 05600 Award 23092 & 23215

Notes:

Gasoline Pricing Valid From:

4/26/2024

Through

1) All prices are taken from the OPIS Weekly Published Newsletter published on Mondays.

2) All prices are per gallon.

3) The volume discount applies to deliveries 5,500 gallons or greater.

Gas Price by Contractor

Vendor

Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
N/A
N/A
Global Montello
N/A
Mirabito Energy
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Buell Fuel
N/A
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
N/A
Mirabito Energy
Mirabito Energy
Mirabito Energy
Buell Fuel
MX Petroleum
MX Petroleum
Global Montello
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Mirabito Energy
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
N/A
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
MX Petroleum
MX Petroleum
N/A
MX Petroleum
MX Petroleum
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Sunoco LP
Global Montello
Global Montello
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
NOCO Energy
NOCO Energy
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
N/A
Sunoco LP
Sunoco LP
Sunoco LP
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Global Montello
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Global Montello
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
N/A
Mirabito Energy
N/A
N/A
N/A
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
N/A
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
N/A
NOCO Energy
NOCO Energy
Buell Fuel
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
N/A
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello

Contract

PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
No Award
No Award
PC69516
No Award
PC69519
PC69517
PC69517
PC69515
No Award
PC69517
PC69517
PC69517
No Award
PC69519
PC69519
PC69519
PC69515
PC69520
PC69520
PC69516
PC69515
PC69515
PC69519
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
No Award
PC69517
PC69517
PC69520
PC69520
No Award
PC69520
PC69520
PC69515
PC69515
PC69523
PC69516
PC69516
PC69515
PC69515
PC69515
PC69515
PC69522
PC69522
PC69521
PC69521
PC69515
PC69515
No Award
PC69523
PC69523
PC69523
PC69515
PC69515
PC69516
PC69522
PC69522
PC69522
PC69516
PC69517
PC69517
PC69517
PC69515
PC69515
No Award
PC69519
No Award
No Award
No Award
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
No Award
PC69517
No Award
PC69521
PC69521
PC69515
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69522
PC69522
PC69522
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
No Award
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516

County

Albany
Albany
Albany
Allegany
Allegany
Bronx
Broome
Broome
Cattaraugus
Cattaraugus
Cayuga
Chautauqua
Chautauqua
Chautauqua
Chautauqua
Chemung
Chemung
Chemung
Chemung
Chenango
Clinton
Clinton
Columbia
Cortland
Cortland
Delaware
Dutchess
Dutchess
Dutchess
Dutchess
Erie

Erie

Erie

Essex
Essex
Franklin
Franklin
Franklin
Fulton
Fulton
Genesee
Greene
Greene
Herkimer
Herkimer
Jefferson
Jefferson
Kings
Kings
Livingston
Livingston
Madison
Madison
Monroe
Monroe
Monroe
Monroe
Montgomery
Montgomery
Nassau
Nassau
Nassau
Nassau
New York
Niagara
Niagara
Niagara
Oneida
Oneida
Onondaga
Onondaga
Ontario
Ontario
Ontario
Orange
Orange
Orange
Orange
Orleans
Orleans
Oswego
Oswego
Oswego
Otsego
Putnam
Putnam
Putnam
Queens
Queens
Queens
Rensselaer
Rensselaer
Rensselaer
Richmond
Rockland
Rockland
Rockland
Rockland
Saratoga
Saratoga
Saratoga
Schenectady

Fuel Type

Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

OPRG (E) Gas Regular
Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Regular

Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Premium

Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Premium

Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Gas Premium

Gas Regular

Flex Fuel (E-85)

OPRG (E) Gas Regular
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range
OPRG (E) Gas Premium
Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Premium

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Gas Premium

Gas Regular

Gas Premium

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

OPRG (E) Gas Regular
OPRG (E) Gas Premium
Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Premium

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Flex Fuel (E-85)

OPRG (E) Gas Regular
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range
OPRG (E) Gas Premium
OPRG (E) Gas Premium
Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Premium

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Premium

Flex Fuel (E-85)

OPRG (E) Gas Regular
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range
OPRG (E) Gas Premium
Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Regular

OPRG (E) Gas Regular
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range
OPRG (E) Gas Premium
OPRG (E) Gas Regular
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range
OPRG (E) Gas Premium
Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

OPRG (E) Gas Regular
Flex Fuel (E-85)

OPRG (E) Gas Regular
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range
OPRG (E) Gas Premium
Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Premium

Gas Regular

Gasoline and E-85

5/2/2024

Current Price

$2.1283
$2.8777
$3.0969
No Bid
No Bid
$2.9301
No Bid
$2.9752
$2.9187
$3.2042
$3.2152
No Bid
$2.9822
$3.2042
$3.5417
No Bid
$3.0252
$3.2802
$3.6777
$3.1697
$3.0552
$3.2802
$3.0033
$3.1902
$3.7572
$3.3252
$2.1538
$2.9335
$3.0343
$3.1749
No Bid
$2.8402
$3.2112
$3.0252
$3.2502
No Bid
$3.0352
$3.5977
$2.8947
$3.1302
$2.9707
$3.0022
$3.5462
$3.0467
$3.6277
$3.1827
$3.5202
$2.9069
$3.1382
$3.0402
$3.3452
$2.9800
$3.4107
No Bid
$2.8707
$3.1407
$3.4782
$2.8675
$3.1202
$2.1413
$2.7436
$2.8593
$2.9749
$3.3710
$2.8737
$3.2042
$3.5467
$3.0465
$3.3681
No Bid
$3.0652
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$2.1564
$2.9361
$3.0369
$3.1175
No Bid
$2.9002
No Bid
$3.0647
$3.2897
$2.9942
$2.9299
$3.0307
$3.1713
$2.7938
$2.9095
$3.0251
$2.1259
$2.9003
$3.1095
No Bid
$2.1441
$2.9238
$3.0246
$3.1652
$2.9466
$3.1658
$3.5506
$2.9498

Volume
Discount Bid Price
$0.0000 $2.5456
$0.0000 $2.3527
$0.0000 $2.4247
N/A No Bid
N/A No Bid
$0.0000 $2.5107
N/A No Bid
$0.0000 $2.4502
$0.0000 $2.3937
$0.0000 $2.5320
$0.0000 $2.6902
N/A No Bid
$0.0000 $2.4572
$0.0000 $2.5320
$0.0000 $2.6487
N/A No Bid
$0.0000 $2.5002
$0.0000 $2.6080
$0.0000 $2.7847
$0.0000 $2.6447
$0.1000 $2.5302
$0.1000 $2.6080
$0.0000 $2.4783
$0.0000 $2.6652
$0.0000 $2.8642
$0.0000 $2.8002
$0.0000 $2.5711
$0.0000 $2.5141
$0.0000 $2.5600
$0.0000 $2.6458
N/A No Bid
$0.0100 $2.3152
$0.0000 $2.5390
$0.1000 $2.5002
$0.1000 $2.5780
N/A No Bid
$0.1000 $2.5102
$0.1000 $2.7047
$0.0000 $2.3697
$0.0000 $2.4580
$0.0000 $2.4457
$0.0000 $2.4772
$0.0000 $2.6532
$0.0000 $2.5217
$0.0000 $2.7347
$0.0000 $2.6577
$0.0000 $2.8480
$0.0000 $2.4875
$0.0000 $2.6091
$0.0000 $2.5152
$0.0100 $2.6730
$0.0000 $2.4550
$0.0000 $2.7385
N/A No Bid
$0.0000 $2.3457
$0.0000 $2.4685
$0.0000 $2.5852
$0.0000 $2.3425
$0.0000 $2.4480
$0.0000 $2.5586
$0.0000 $2.3242
$0.0000 $2.3850
$0.0000 $2.4458
$0.0000 $2.8419
$0.0100 $2.3487
$0.0000 $2.5320
$0.0000 $2.6537
$0.0000 $2.5215
$0.0000 $2.6959
N/A No Bid
$0.0000 $2.5402
N/A No Bid
N/A No Bid
N/A No Bid
$0.0000 $2.5737
$0.0000 $2.5167
$0.0000 $2.5626
$0.0000 $2.5884
N/A No Bid
$0.0500 $2.3752
N/A No Bid
$0.0650 $2.5397
$0.0650 $2.6175
$0.0000 $2.4692
$0.0000 $2.5105
$0.0000 $2.5564
$0.0000 $2.6422
$0.0000 $2.3744
$0.0000 $2.4352
$0.0000 $2.4960
$0.0000 $2.5432
$0.0000 $2.3753
$0.0000 $2.4373
N/A No Bid
$0.0000 $2.5614
$0.0000 $2.5044
$0.0000 $2.5503
$0.0000 $2.6361
$0.0000 $2.4216
$0.0000 $2.4936
$0.0000 $2.6576
$0.0000 $2.4248
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Group 05600 Award 23092 & 23215

Global Montello
Buell Fuel
Sunoco LP

N/A
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel

N/A

MX Petroleum
Sunoco LP
Sunoco LP

Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating

Global Montello

Mirabito Energy
Buell Fuel

Global Montello

Global Montello

Global Montello

Global Montello

Global Montello

Main Brothers Oil

Main Brothers Oil

N/A
Sunoco LP
Sunoco LP

Global Montello

Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
N/A
N/A

Gasoline Pricing Valid From:

PC69516
PC69515
PC69523
No Award
PC69515
PC69515
PC69515
No Award
PC69520
PC69523
PC69523
PC69522
PC69522
PC69522
PC69522
PC69516
PC69519
PC69515
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69516
PC69518
PC69518
No Award
PC69523
PC69523
PC69516
PC69522
PC69522
PC69522
PC69517
No Award
No Award

4/26/2024

Schenectady
Schoharie
Schuyler
Seneca
Seneca
Seneca
Seneca

St. Lawrence
St. Lawrence
Steuben
Steuben
Suffolk
Suffolk
Suffolk
Suffolk
Sullivan
Tioga
Tompkins
Ulster

Ulster

Ulster
Warren
Warren
Washington
Washington
Wayne
Wayne
Wayne
Westchester
Westchester
Westchester
Westchester
Wyoming
Yates

Yates

Through

Gas Mid Range

Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Premium

Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Flex Fuel (E-85)

OPRG (E) Gas Regular
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range
OPRG (E) Gas Premium
Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Premium

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Flex Fuel (E-85)

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Flex Fuel (E-85)

OPRG (E) Gas Regular
OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range
OPRG (E) Gas Premium
Gas Regular

Gas Regular

Gas Mid Range

Gasoline and E-85

5/2/2024

$3.1090
$2.9402
$3.1167
No Bid
$3.2697
$3.5152
$3.8577
No Bid
$3.0852
$3.0967
$3.3417
$2.1242
$2.7498
$2.8655
$2.9811
$2.9781
$3.2752
$3.0147
$2.9383
$3.1475
$3.5023
$2.9300
$3.1392
$2.9902
$3.2302
No Bid
$3.0267
$3.2717
$2.1552
$2.8276
$2.9433
$3.0589
$2.9822
No Bid
No Bid

$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
N/A
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
N/A
$0.1000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
N/A
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
N/A
N/A

$2.4368
$2.4152
$2.5917
No Bid
$2.7447
$2.8430
$2.9647
No Bid
$2.5602
$2.5717
$2.6695
$2.5415
$2.3304
$2.3912
$2.4520
$2.4531
$2.7502
$2.4897
$2.4133
$2.4753
$2.6093
$2.4050
$2.4670
$2.4652
$2.5580
No Bid
$2.5017
$2.5995
$2.5725
$2.4082
$2.4690
$2.5298
$2.4572
No Bid
No Bid
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