

Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER	20881
BID OPENING	5/15/2007
GROUP NUMBER	35200
PURCHASING OFFICER	Jill McCabe
TELEPHONE	(518) 474-2804

DESCRIPTION

Firearms, Ammunition, Handcuffs, Batons, Holsters and
Targets
(Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
AMCHAR WHOLESALE, LLC
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT I – FIREARMS

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/ Price List Identification (including Date)
1.	Beretta	WHLS TAX OUT -1%	2007 LAW ENF. DEALER PRICE LIST 1/1/07
	Law Enforcement Firearms:		
	Accessories:	WHSL + 9%	2007 Beretta USA Price
	Sporting Arms:	WHSL + 5%	2007 Silver Dist List
			Firearms Price List
	Delivery:	Aprox 30 Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	Accokeek, MD	
		20607	
2.	Colt	Fet Out + 3.75%	Colt Defense LLC 2007 Law Enf. Pricing
	Law Enforcement Firearms:	Retail -42%	Colt Defense LLC 2007 Law Enf. Pricing
	Accessories:		
	Sporting Arms:	Retail -26.75%	2007 Colt Domestic Retail Price List
	Delivery:	Aprox 30-90 Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	Hartford, CT	
		06144	

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT I – FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/ Price List Identification (including Date)
3.	Glock Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms: Delivery: Address of Plant where Manufactured:	Suggested Agency -1% Suggested Agency -13.75% N/A Aprox 30 Smyrna, GA 30082	2007 LAW ENF. PRICE LIST 2007 Glock Accessory Price List There is no Difference Between Law And Sporting
4.	Heckler & Koch Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms: Delivery: Address of Plant where Manufactured:	L/E Price -3% L/E Price -3% N/A Varies 30-90 Sterling VA 20166	L/E Price List 1/1/07 Amchar is a Law Enf. Dist for H&K Only

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
GLOCK, INC.

LOT I – FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog Price List Identification (including Date)
3.	Glock APPLIES TO ALL MODELS OF GLOCK PISTOLS, PER PRICE LIST, Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms: Delivery: Address of Plant where Manufactured:	0 0 N/A 60 GLOCK, INC. 6000 HIGHLANDS PKWY. SMYRNA, GA GLOCK GES. m.b.h. A-2232 DEUTSCH WAGRAM, AUSTRIA	2007 LE PRICE LIST 2007 LE PRICE LIST N/A
4.	Heckler & Koch Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms: Delivery: Address of Plant where Manufactured:	No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
AM CHAR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT I - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/ Price List Identification (including Date)
5.	Mossberg	Dist -9%	2007 LE Price List
	Law Enforcement Firearms:		
	Accessories:	Dist +2%	2007 Dist Price List
	Sporting Arms:	Dist +2%	2007 Dist Price List
	Delivery:	Aprox 30 Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	North Haven CT	
		06473	
6.	Remington	Tax out + 5%	2007 LE/MIL/FA NET Price List 12/01/06
	Law Enforcement Firearms:	MSP-NET	Gun Parts (accessories) 1/1,
	Accessories:		
	Sporting Arms:	MSP-NET	2007 RACI DOMESTIC SPORTING 11/01/06
	Delivery:	Aprox 30 Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	14 HOefker Ave	
		Illion, NY 13357	

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT I - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/ Price List Identification (including Date)
7.	Ruger	Net Dist + 1%	2007 Le Dist Price Sheet
	Law Enforcement Firearms:		
	Accessories:	Retail -42.5%	2007 DIST PRICE Sheet
	Sporting Arms:	Retail-42.08%	2007 Dist for LE Olny
	Delivery:	Aprox 30 Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	Southport CT 06890	
8.	Savage	N/A	Not Produced
	Law Enforcement Firearms:	Dealer Net	2007 Dist Price Llist
	Accessories:	Dist -2%	2007 Dist Price List
	Sporting Arms:		
	Delivery:	Aprox 30 Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	Suffield, CT 06078	

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

STANDARD LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY CO.
190 Mineola Ave.
Roslyn Heights, N.Y. 11577
Tel. (516) 484-5892

LOT I - FIREARMS (cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/ Price List Identification (including Date)
9.	SigArms Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms: Delivery: Address of Plant where Manufactured:	 ____ Days ARO 	 No Bid This Item

10.	Smith & Wesson Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms: Delivery: Address of Plant where Manufactured:	 ____ Days ARO 	 "SUGG. RETAIL MINUS THE FOLLOWING PERCENTAGES: 46.6% 40% 46.6% "SMITH & WESSON DOMESTIC CONFIDENTIAL LAW ENFORCEMENT DISTRIBUTOR/DEALER PRICE LIST EFFECTIVE MAY 1, 2007"
-----	--	---	---

PLEASE NOTE:
PRICES FOR FIREARMS ARE VALID FOR
FEDERAL EXCISE TAX EXEMPT ORDERS.
ALL OTHER NON FEDERAL EXCISE TAX EXEMPT
ORDERS MUST ADD 10%.

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder: **AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.**
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT I - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
11.	US Repeating Arms (Winchester) Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms:	N/A Wholesale Price (net) 2007 Wholesale Price (net) Confidential	Not Produced Price List
	Delivery:	Aprox 30 Days ARO	Wholesale Price List
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	Morgan, UT 84050	
12.	Other: <u>Benelli</u> Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms:	WHLS TAX OUT + 5 % WHSL + 9% n/a	Beretta 2007 Law Enf Dealer Price list pages 7-9 2007 Beretta USA Price Not Available
	Delivery:	30-60 Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	Pocomoke, MD 21851	

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder: **AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.**
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT I - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
11.	US Repeating Arms (Winchester) Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms:		
	Delivery:		
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:		
12.	Other: <u>BUSHMASTER</u> Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms:	List Price + 9.5% MSRP -3% msrp -38%	L/E DIST. PROGRAM 2007 12/06 2007 Bushmaster Catalog Bushmaster 2007 Suggested Retail Prices
	Delivery:	Aprox 30 Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	Windham ME 04062	

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder: AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Cir.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT I - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
11.	US Repeating Arms (Winchester) Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms:	 	
	Delivery:	Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:		

12.	Other: <u>Kahr Arms</u> Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms:	FET OUT +5% Dist + 15% N/A Aprox 30 Days ARO	2007 LE DIST Program Same As Ablve There is no difference between law and spotting models. Worcester, MA 01603
-----	--	---	--

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder: AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Cir.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT I - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
11.	US Repeating Arms (Winchester) Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms:	 	
	Delivery:	Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:		

12.	Other: <u>FNH USA</u> Law Enforcement Firearms: Accessories: Sporting Arms:	Dist +6% LE Agency -10% N/A Aprox 30-60 Days ARO	2007 LE Dist Pricing 11/1/06 Amchar is Law ENf Dist only for FNH Mclean, VA 22101
-----	--	---	--

(continued)

GROUP 35200 – FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PAGE 23

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder **EAGLE POINT GUN**
T.J. MORRIS & SON
1707 THIRD STREET
THOROFARE, NJ 08066
856-348-6045LOT II – AMMUNITION (New)Item
No. Description

1. Federal

% Discount
from Price List

29%

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)2007 Retail Price List
EFF. 09 MAY 2007

Delivery: 30-300 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Federal Cartridge Company
900 Ehlen Drive
Anoka, Minnesota 55303

2. Simunition

Delivery: _____ Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

TJM 14 MAY 2007

THOMAS J. MORRIS, III
EAGLE POINT GUN
T.J. MORRIS & SON
1707 THIRD STREET
THOROFARE, NJ 08066EAGLE POINT GUN
T.J. MORRIS & SON
1707 THIRD STREET
THOROFARE, NJ 08066
856-348-6045

(continued)

20881i.doc/T05jmc

GROUP 35200 – FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PAGE 23

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder **AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.**
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624LOT II – AMMUNITION (New)Item
No. Description

1. Federal

% Discount
from Price ListCatalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

Delivery: _____

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

NO BID

2. Simunition

Delivery: 30 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

5 Montee Des Arsenaux
Le Gardeur, Quebec
J5Z1P4L/E W/O FET
+ 4% 2-U.S. LAW ENFORCEMENT
EFFECTIVE 10/26/07

(continued)

20881i.doc/T05jmc

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT II – AMMUNITION (New) (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
3.	Speer (CCI, Lawman, Blazer)	RETAIL -29.5%	SPEER LE 2007 RETAIL PRICE LIST 5/9/07
		VARIED 30-90	Days ARO
	Delivery:		
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:		Lewiston, ID 83501
4.	Remington	Net Price Tax Out +6%	2007 Law Enf Ammo Price List Effective 6/1/07-See attached Remington Letter
		Varied 30-90	Days ARO
	Delivery:		
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:		Madison, NC 27025

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

JUREK BROTHERS

LOT II – AMMUNITION (New) (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
5.	Winchester	45%	L.E. RETAIL AUGUST 1, 20
		Delivery: 30-60 Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	427 N. SHAMROCK ST. EAST ALTON, IL. 62024	
6.	Other: _____		
		Delivery: N/B Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	_____ _____	

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, REVISED PAGE 25
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide) PAGE 4 PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

*Evergreen Specialty
Services*

LOT II - AMMUNITION (New) (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

5. Winchester

% Discount
from Price List Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

No Bid

Delivery: _____ Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

6. Other: *Hornady mfg.*

35%

*Hornady TAP Law
Enforcement 2007*

Delivery: *21* Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

*3625 W Old Potash Hwy
Grand Island, NE 68403*

20881p.doc/T05jmc

(continued)

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, REVISED PAGE 25
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide) PAGE 4 PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

*Evergreen Specialty
Services*

LOT II - AMMUNITION (New) (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

5. Winchester

% Discount
from Price List Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

No Bid

Delivery: _____ Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

6. Other: *Kilgore Flares
(Frangible Ammunition)*

35%

*Law Enforcement
Frangible 2007*

Delivery: *21* Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

*155 Kilgore Drive
Toone, TN 38381*

20881p.doc/T05jmc

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
JIM CHAR WHOLESALL, INC
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT III – HANDCUFFS

Item No.	Description
1.	American Handcuff Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
_____	_____
_____ Days A	NO BID
_____	_____
_____	_____

2. Hiatt-Thompson Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

_____	_____
_____ Day	NO BID
_____	_____
_____	_____

3. Peerless Handcuff Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Retail -45%	Retail Price List Effective 2-1-07
_____	_____
30 Days ARO	_____
Springfield, MA	_____
01103	_____

Bidder
Armor Holdings Products LLC

% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
_____	_____
_____ Days ARO	_____
_____	_____
_____	_____

15% Hiatt 2007 Price List
30 Days ARO
126 NH RT 12W
Fitzwilliam, NH 03447

_____	_____
_____ Days ARO	_____
_____	_____
_____	_____

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

RELIAPON POLICE PRODUCTS, INC.

LOT III – HANDCUFFS

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
1.	American Handcuff Co.		
	Delivery:	Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:		
2.	Hiatt-Thompson Co.	23%	H-T 2007 Retail P/L
	Delivery:	14 Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:	7200 W. 66th St. Bedford Park, IL 60638	
3.	Peerless Handcuff Co.		
	Delivery:	Days ARO	
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:		

Bidder

Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc.

% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
	NO BID
	Days ARO
40%	Retail Price Sheet dated 5/10/07
30-45	Days ARO
	7200 W. 66th Street Bedford Park, IL 60638
40%	Retail Price Sheet dated 1/24/07
30-45	Days ARO
	33 Rose Place Springfield, MA 01104

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT III – HANDCUFFS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
4.	Smith & Wesson	Retail -41%	2007 S&W Dist Pricing 5/1/07

Delivery: 30 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured: Springfield MA 01102

5. Other: C&S SECURITY, INC. RETAIL 2007 PRODUCT LIST -9%

Delivery: 30 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured: Roscommon, MI 48653

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
JUREK BROTHERS

LOT III – HANDCUFFS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
----------	-------------	----------------------------	--

4. Smith & Wesson

25% OFF RETAIL L.E. DIST. MAY 1, 2007

Delivery: 30-60 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured: 2100 ROOSEVELT AVE. SPRINGFIELD, MA, 01102

5. Other: _____

Delivery: _____ Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured: _____

N/B

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder: **STANDARD LAW ENFORCEMENT SUPPLY CO.**
190 Mineola Ave.
Roslyn Heights, N.Y. 11577
Tel. (516) 484-5892

LOT III – HANDCUFFS (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
4.	Smith & Wesson <div>"SUGG. RETAIL" MINUS (-) THE NOTED PERCENTAGE →</div>	36.5% 30-90 Days ARO	"SMITH & WESSON DOMESTIC CONFIDENTIAL LAW ENFORCEMENT DISTRIBUTOR/DEALER EFFECTIVE MAY 1, 2007"
	Delivery:		
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:		19 AVIATION DR., HOUSTON ME. 2100 ROOSEVELT AVE., SPRINGFIELD, MA. 01102
5.	Other:		
	Delivery:		
	Address of Plant where Manufactured:		

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
ANCHOR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT IV – BATONS

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
1.	ASP	Retail -37%	Jan. 2007 Retail Price List
Delivery:		30	Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured:		Appleton WI,	
		54912	
2.	Kohaut & Co.		
Delivery:			Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured:			

NO BID

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Kohaut & Co

LOT IV – BATONS

Item
No. Description

1. ASP

% Discount
from Price List Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

Days ARO

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

2. Kohaut & Co.

0% SEE ATTACHED PRICELIST
BEHIND THIS PAGE

15 Days ARO

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

3130 CORRAL TRAIL ROAD

SOMERSET CA. 95684

P.O. Box 518
MT. AUKUM CA. 95656

K & Co.
KOHAUT
A Division of John C. Kohaut, Inc.

Established 1887

P.O. BOX 518 MT. AUKUM, CA 95656

(530) 620-2044 OFFICE (530) 620-2046 FAX

N.Y.S PRICELIST FOR WOODEN NIGHTSTICKS, RIOT
BATONS AND BILLY CLUBS. EFFECTIVE 6/1/2007

BILLY CLUB MODEL 25

Hickory 8" \$10.00ea
Dymondwood 8" \$21.50ea

BILLY CLUB MODEL 50

Hickory 13" \$10.00ea
Dymondwood 13" \$21.50ea

LAPD BATON MODEL 100

Hickory 26" \$ 5.75ea.
Hickory 29" \$ 5.75ea.
Hickory 36" \$ 6.50ea.
Hickory 42" \$ 8.50ea.
Dymondwood 26" \$25.00ea.
Dymondwood 29" \$25.00ea.

NYPD BATON MODEL 200

Hickory 26" \$10.50ea.
Dymondwood 26" \$22.50ea.

CHICAGO CLUB MODEL 300

Hickory 23" \$10.50ea
Dymondwood 23" \$25.00ea.

RIOT BATON MODEL 400

Hickory 36" \$14.75ea.
Dymondwood 36" \$35.00ea

DETROIT BATON MODEL 500

Hickory 23" \$10.50ea.
Dymondwood 23" \$22.50ea

RIOT BATON MODEL 600

Hickory 36" \$14.50ea.
Dymondwood 36" \$32.50ea

FANCY DRESS STICK MODEL 700

Hickory 24" \$15.50ea.
Dymondwood 24" \$25.00ea.

ACCESSORIES

Rubber Grommets \$ 1.00ea.
Leather Thongs \$ 1.00ea.

AVAILABLE WOOD FINISHES

Hickory: Black, Mahogany, Natural
Dymondwood: Black, Charcoal, Cocobolo

TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Net 30 days upon approval of credit.
FOB Destination, price includes freight to your facility

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Armor Holdings Products LLC

LOT IV – BATONS (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

3. Monadnock

% Discount
from Price List

15%

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

Monadnock 2007 Price List

Delivery:

30 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

126 NH RT 12N
Fitzwilliam, NH 03447

4. Other: _____

Delivery:

_____ Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Evergreen Specialty Services

LOT IV – BATONS (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

3. Monadnock

% Discount
from Price List

No Bid

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

Delivery:

_____ Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

4. Other: Mixson/PPCT

Delivery:

10 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

3079 West 80th Street
Hialeah, FL 33016

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Armor Holdings Products LLC

LOT V – HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES

Item
No. Description

1. Bianci

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

% Discount
from Price List

25%

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

Bianchi 2007 Price List

30 Days ARO

P.O. Box 9015
Temecula, CA 92589-9015

2. DeSantis

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Days ARO

3. Don Hume

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Days ARO

Bidder Helgen Industries Inc. 9/18/07
DeSantis Holster & Leather Goods
431 Bayview Ave
Amityville, N.Y. 11701

% Discount
from Price List

/

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

/

Days ARO

/

23%

Vol. XXX 1/2007.

30 Days ARO

431 Bayview Ave
Amityville, N.Y. 11701

/

/

Days ARO

/

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

NEW YORK POLICE SUPPLY INC.

1460 RIDGE RD. EAST
ROCHESTER, NY 14621
PHONE 585-467-1370
FAX 585-467-2870
ORDERS 1-800-262-2822

**LOT V – HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES**

Item
No. Description

1. Bianci

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

% Discount
from Price List

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

_____ Days ARO

2. DeSantis

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

_____ Days ARO

3. Don Hume

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

32%

JAN 1, 2007 RETAIL Price

30 Days ARO

Miami, OK

Bidder

Lawren's & Shooters' Supply, Inc.

% Discount
from Price List

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

NO BID

_____ Days ARO

30%

Retail Price Sheet dated 1/1/07

30-45 Days ARO

431 Bayview Avenue

Amityville, NY 11701

40%

Retail Price Sheet dated 1/1/07

30-45 Days ARO

500 26th Street NW

Miami, OK 74354

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc.

LOT V – HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
4.	Safariland		NO BID

Delivery: _____ Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

5. Other: Gould & Goodrich 40% Retail Price Sheet dated 1/15/07

Delivery: 30-45 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

709 E. McNeil Street
Lillington, NC 27546

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

NEW YORK POLICE SUPPLY, INC.
1460 RIDGE RD. EAST
ROCHESTER, NY 14621
PHONE 585-467-1370
FAX 585-467-2870
ORDERS 1-800-262-2832

LOT V – HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description	% Discount from Price List	Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)
4.	Safariland		

Delivery: _____ Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

5. Other: UNCLE MIKE'S 20% JAN 1, 2007
LAW ENFORCEMENT

Delivery: 30 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

OVERLAND PARK, KS.

6. CUTTS CUSTOM LEATHER 10 JAN 1, 2007
30 DAYS ARO
ROCHESTER, N.Y.

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder: AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT V – HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description
4.	Safariland

% Discount Catalog/Price List
from Price List Identification (including Date)

NO BID

LIST Official 2007 Dealer
-32% Price List 12/15/06

5. Other: BLACKHAWK OUTDOORS

Delivery: _____
Address of Plant where Manufactured: _____

30 Days ARO
Norfolk, VA
23502

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder: AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT V – HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd)

Item No.	Description
4.	Safariland

% Discount Catalog/Price List
from Price List Identification (including Date)

NO BID

5. Other: Gould & Goodrich

Delivery: _____
Address of Plant where Manufactured: _____

Retail Suggested Retail
- 46% Price List Effective

30 Days ARO
Lillington, NC
27546

(continued)

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PAGE 31

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Armor Holdings Products LLC

LOT V - HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

4. Safariland

% Discount
from Price List

25%

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

Safariland 2007 Price List

Delivery:

30 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

3120 East Mission Blvd
Ontario, CA 91761

5. Other: _____

Delivery:

_____ Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

(continued)

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PAGE 31

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Evergreen Specialty Services

LOT V - HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

4. Safariland

% Discount
from Price List

No Bid

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

Delivery:

_____ Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

5. Other: Mixson

Delivery:

40%

15 Days ARO

Mixson / PECT Prod
Police + Sporting Equ

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

3079 West 80th Street
Hialeah, FL 33016

(continued)

20991

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide) PAGE 5 PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

REVISED PAGE 32

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

EAGLE POINT GUN
T.J. MORRIS & SON
1707 THIRD STREET
THOROFARE, NJ 08086
856-848-6945

LOT VI- TARGETS

1. Speedwell	Estimated Quantity	Price Per 100	Extension Price	Count Per Box	Catalog Name
Description					Speedwell
FBI-Q	30,000	\$ 17.00	\$ 5100.00	200	01 Feb 2006
B27FS	12,000	\$ 27.50	\$ 3300.00	100	71
B27EGY	50,000	\$ 19.00	\$ 9500.00	200	71
B27FSNYSP	50,000	\$ 23.10	\$ 11,550.00	100	71
B21FSR	12,000	\$ 28.45	\$ 3414.00	100	71
B60CT	6,000	\$ 24.75	\$ 1485.00	200	71
SR1	3,000	\$ 21.00	\$ 630.00	250	71
B21XNS	3,000	\$ 23.50	\$ 705.00	200	71
B21XFS	10,000	\$ 30.75	\$ 3075.00	100	71
B21FSNYSP	12,000	\$ 23.10	\$ 2772.00	100	71
Grand Total:			\$ 41,351.00		

% Discount for Remainder of Targets in Speedwell Catalog:

Paper: _____
Cardboard: _____
Steel: _____
Delivery: 30 Days ARO

} See attached for various
discounts by page and
category.

2. Other: _____

Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)

THOMAS J. MORRIS, III % Discount for Targets in Catalog:
EAGLE POINT GUN
T.J. MORRIS & SON
1707 THIRD STREET
THOROFARE, NJ 08086

Paper: _____
Cardboard: _____
Steel: _____

TJME
14 MAR 07

EAGLE POINT GUN
T.J. MORRIS & SON
1707 THIRD STREET
THOROFARE, NJ 08086
856-848-6945

Delivery: _____ Days ARO

20881p.doc/T05jmc

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PAGE 32

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGET

LOT VI- TARGETS

1. Speedwell	Estimated Quantity	Price Per 100	Extension Price	Count Per Box	Catalog Name
Description					
FBI-Q	30,000	\$ 22. ⁰⁰	\$ 6600. ⁰⁰	200	LAW ENFORCEMENT TARGET
B27FS	12,000	\$ 37. ⁰⁰	\$ 4440. ⁰⁰	200	LET
B27EGY	50,000	\$ 24. ⁰⁰	\$ 12000. ⁰⁰	200	LET
B27FSNYSP	50,000	\$ NO BID			-
B21FSR	12,000	\$ NO BID			-
B60CT	6,000	\$ 24. ⁰⁰	\$ 1440. ⁰⁰	200	LET
SR1	3,000	\$ 30. ⁰⁰	\$ 900. ⁰⁰		LET
B21XNS	3,000	\$ 37. ⁰⁰	\$ 1110. ⁰⁰	200	LET
B21XFS	10,000	\$ 37. ⁰⁰	\$ 3700. ⁰⁰		
B21FSNYSP	12,000	\$ NO BID			-

% Discount for Remainder of Targets in Speedwell Catalog:

Paper: _____
Cardboard: _____
Steel: _____

Delivery: _____ Days ARO

2. Other: _____

% Discount for Targets in Catalog:

Paper: 50%
Cardboard: 50%
Steel: 50%

Delivery: 20 Days ARO

(continued)

HANDCUFFS, BATONS, REVISED PAGE 32
PAGE 5 PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

Bidder
AMCHAR WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester NY 14624

Price Per 100	Extension Price	Count Per Box	Catalog Name
\$ 18.20	\$ 36.40	200	2006 preferred Dist
\$ 30.49	\$ 30.49	100	
\$ 20.72	\$ 41.44	200	
\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	100	
\$ 30.49	\$ 30.49	100	
\$ 24.08	\$ 48.16	200	
\$ 23.18	\$ 57.95	250	
\$ 26.08	\$ 52.16	200	
\$ 33.88	\$ 33.88	100	
\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	100	

Grand Total: \$44,948.20

-43% off List
-3% off List
-3% off List

30 Days ARO

Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)

Days ARO

HANDCUFFS, BATONS,
(Statewide)

PAGE 32

Bidder
Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc.

Price Per 100	Extension Price	Count Per Box	Catalog Name
\$ 19.32	\$ 5,796.00	200	L/E Clubs 2006
\$ 31.61	\$ 3,793.20	100	" " "
\$ 21.84	\$ 10,920.00	200	" " "
\$ 36.20	\$ 18,100.00	100	" " "
\$ 31.61	\$ 3,793.20	100	" " "
\$ 25.20	\$ 1,512.00	200	" " "
\$ 24.31	\$ 729.30	250	" " "
\$ 27.21	\$ 816.30	200	" " "
\$ 35.00	\$ 3,500.00	100	" " "
\$ 36.20	\$ 4,344.00	100	" " "

SEE ATTACHED

30 Days ARO

NO BID
Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)

Days ARO

(continued)