

Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER	<u>20999</u>
BID OPENING	<u>8/7/2007</u>
GROUP NUMBER	<u>31504</u>
PURCHASING OFFICER	<u>Joseph Hodder</u>
TELEPHONE	<u>(518) 474-3668</u>

DESCRIPTION

Bituminous Concrete Cold Patch
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Amenia Sand & Gravel, Inc.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ 63.75
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ No Bid

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer	\$ No Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
1+ Kilometers	\$ No Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY / COUNTY
307 Leedsville Road, Amenia, NY 12501
Dutchess County
10147 (Port Ewen)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

CH
ions)

Bidder

Buffalo Crushed Stone, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 69.10
\$ N/A
\$ N/A
\$ N/A
\$ N/A

\$ 2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.18 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Lancaster Erie
10106

CH
ions)

Bidder

Buffalo Crushed Stone, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 69.10
\$ N/A
\$ N/A
\$ N/A
\$ N/A

\$2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.18 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Cheektowaga Erie
10096

GROUP 31504 – BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

ALBANY Asphalt &
Aggregates Corp.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ 61.00
\$
\$ 88.25
\$
\$

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

\$ 2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.28 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Port of Albany - Albany, NY - Albany
10001
County

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

CH
ons)

PAGE 30

Bidder

ALLIANCE PAVING MATERIALS
ROME, NEW YORK 13440

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ 57.70
\$ 57.70
\$ 80.20
\$ 74.20
\$ 80.20

\$ 2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.24 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
ROME, NY - ONEIDA COUNTY
10043

CH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Barre Stone Products, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ 60.00/MT
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ NB

\$ 1.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Albion/Orleans
10306

GROUP 31504 – BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.
4530 Wetzel Road
Liverpool, NY 13090

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ 59.91
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ 88.00

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer	\$ 1.80 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
1+ Kilometers	\$.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY / COUNTY
Jamesville, NY -Onondaga
10349

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

CH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder
BROOME BITUMINOUS PROD., INC.

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 49.75
\$ 59.50
\$ 79.90
\$ 68.50
\$ 79.00

\$ 1.50	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
VESTAL, NY BROOME CO.
10350

CH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder BLADES
Construction Products Corporation
7610 County Route 65
P.O. Box 590
Hornell, NY 14843

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 75.00
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ 86.00
\$ NB

\$ 2.00	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.20	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Hornell (Steuben Co.)
10327

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.
P.O. Box 400
Washington Mills, NY 13479

Bidder
Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.
P.O. Box 400
Washington Mills, NY 13479

Bidder
Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.
P.O. Box 400
Washington Mills, NY 13479

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ 68.00
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$ 81.00
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ No Bid

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 58.00
\$ 58.00
\$ 88.00
\$ No Bid
\$ 88.00

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 58.00
\$ 58.00
\$ 88.00
\$ No Bid
\$ 88.00

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

\$ No Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$ 1.80 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$ 1.80 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

1+ Kilometers

\$ No Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY / COUNTY
City of Binghamton - Broome County
10180

CITY / COUNTY
Boonville, NY - Lewis County
NYS Rt. 12
10138

CITY / COUNTY
Litchfield, NY - Herkimer County
363 Rasbach Road
10323

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

GROUP 31504 – BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.
26572 NYS Rt. 37
Watertown, NY 13601

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NB
\$ 57.50
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ NB

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NB
\$ 57.50
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ NB

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NB
\$ 57.50
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ NB

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

\$ 0.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

\$ 0.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

\$ 0.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY/COUNTY
Watertown Facility, Watertown, NY
Jefferson County
10231/10277

CITY/COUNTY
Westville, Franklin County
Ferris Road, Constable, NY
10139

CITY/COUNTY
Norwood Facility, Norwood, NY
St. Lawrence County
10137/10261

PATCH
divisions)

PAGE 30

PCH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder
Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.
379 Ferris Road
Constable, NY 12926

Bidder
Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.
7971 State HWY 56
Norwood, NY 13668

ted)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
VESTAL ASPHALT, INC.

Bidder
SENECA STONE CORP.

Bidder
VESTAL ASPHALT, INC.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ No Bid
\$ 63.49
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ 82.49

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ 60.65
\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ 85.50

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ No Bid
\$ 63.49
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ 82.49

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer
1+ Kilometers

\$ 1.75 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Sangerfield/Oneida

#30204

\$.60 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
FAYETTE, NY SENECA

\$ 1.75 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Vestal/Broome

0903

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Suit-Kote Corp.
W. Oneonta, NY

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$ 58.00
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ 84.00

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

\$ 2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

1+ Kilometers

\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

CITY / COUNTY
W. Oneonta, NY Otsego Co.

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

30902

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

CH
ions)

Bidder

Suit-Kote Corp.
Jamestown, NY

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ 84.00

\$ 2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Jamestown, NY Chautauqua Co.

30501

CH
ions)

Bidder

Suit-Kote Corp.
McGraw, NY

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ 60.00
\$ 58.00
\$ 85.00
\$ 77.00
\$ 80.00

\$ 2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Polkville, NY Cortland Co.

10237

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

SCATT MATERIALS CORP.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ <u>N/B</u>
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$ <u>N/B</u>
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ <u>\$118.50</u>
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$ <u>N/B</u>
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ <u>\$118.50</u>

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer
1+ Kilometers

\$ N/B per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ N/B per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Bay Shore, NY / Suffolk
10-293

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder

Suit-Kote Corp.
Watertown, NY

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ 84.00

\$ 2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Watertown, NY Jefferson Co.
30703

Bidder

Suit-Kote Corp.
Watkins Glen, NY

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton
\$ No Bid
\$ 58.00
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ 84.00

\$ 2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Watkins Glen, NY Schuyler Co.
30603

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder

PECKHAM MATERIALS CORP

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ 83.75
\$ _____
\$ _____

\$.75 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$.35 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

WILLIAM E. DAILEY, INC.
CITY / COUNTY
SHAFTSBURY VT, (BENNINGTON)
10028

TCH
sions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

PECKHAM MATERIALS CORP.
20 HAARLEM AVENUE
WHITE PLAINS, N.Y. 10603

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ 93.75
\$ _____
\$ _____

\$ _____ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$ _____ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
HARRIS Rd. BEDFORD - WESTCHESTER
10172

TCH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Tilcon New York Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ 113.55
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid

\$ No Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$ No Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Tilcon W. Nyack Asphalt - W. Nyack, NY, Roc
10158

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
Pallette Stone Corp.

Bidder
PECKHAM MATERIALS

Bidder
PECKHAM MATERIALS

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ 89.00
\$ 15
\$ 13

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 64.00
\$
\$
\$
\$

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$
\$
\$ 83.00
\$
\$

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer
1+ Kilometers

\$ NB	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ NB	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

\$.65	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.30	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

\$.65	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.30	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY / COUNTY
Saratoga Springs, NY
10016

CITY / COUNTY
HUDSON FALLS, WASHINGTON
10010, 10014

CITY / COUNTY
CATSKILL, GREENE
10285

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

GROUP 31504 – BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder **NASSAU ASPHALT SUPPLY CORP.**
ALBA RASON ASPHALT
P.O. BOX 530
OLD BETHPAGE, NY 11804

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ 85.50
\$ 85.50
\$ 135.00
\$ No bid
\$ No Bid

\$ 6.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.45 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Melville, Suffolk County
10307

55938252

T-919 P036/057 F-260

FCH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder
Northern Bituminous Mix, Inc.
32 Silk Road
Fulton, NY 13069

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ no bid
\$ no bid
\$ 92.45
\$ no bid
\$ no bid

\$ no bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ no bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Fulton / Oswego
10063

FCH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder
PACKAGE PAVEMENT

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ —
\$ 68.00
\$ —
\$ —
\$ 88.00

\$ — per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ — per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Stormville, Dutchess
N/A

(continued)

GROUP 31504 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30

TCH
(ions)

PAGE 30

TCH
(ions)

PAGE 30

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder N J BRUNELL & SON INC.
4019 RT. 22
PLATTSBURGH, NY 12901
PHONE (518) 561-1290
FAX (518) 582-2859

Bidder Lafarge
Lockport Quarry
400 Hinman Road, Lockport

Bidder
Midland Asphalt Materials Inc.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ 114.00

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ 94.03

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ 62.25
\$ 99.00
\$ _____
\$ _____

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Handling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer
1+ Kilometers

\$.73 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.298 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

\$ _____ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ _____ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

\$ _____ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ _____ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY/COUNTY CLINTON COUNTY
4019 RT. 22, PLATTSBURGH, N.Y.
30702

CITY/COUNTY
Lockport, Niagara Co.
10101

CITY/COUNTY
Allegany, NY Cattaraugus Co.
30505

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)

d)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

I.M. & S. INC

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ 76.85

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

\$ 0.55 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

1+ Kilometers

\$ 0.18 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

CITY / COUNTY

SKANEATELES / ONONDAGA

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

10052

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

CH
ons)

Bidder

JAMESTOWN MACADAM, INC.
Walden Avenue
P.O. Box 518
Celoron, New York 14720-0518

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ 82.45
\$ _____
\$ 99.00
\$ _____
\$ _____

\$ 2.91 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$.13 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Jamestown, Chautauqua

10260

ATCH
isions)

Bidder

JOINTA GALUSHALL

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NO BID
\$ NO BID
\$ 94.00
\$ NO BID
\$ NO BID

\$ NB per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$ NB per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Glens Falls, Warren

10015

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

I.M.U.S. INC

Bidder

I.M.U.S. INC

Bidder

I.M.U.S. INC

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ 81.95
\$ _____
\$ _____

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ 81.95
\$ _____
\$ 81.95

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ 87.95
\$ _____
\$ _____

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

\$ 0.55 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.18 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
ALBANY / ORLEANS
10306

\$ 0.55 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.18 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
BUFFALO / ERIE
10250, 10106, 10095

\$ 0.55 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.18 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
NEWBURGH / ORLEANS
10167

(continued)

d)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ 52.00
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

1+ Kilometers

\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

CITY / COUNTY
Oriskany Falls, NY Oneida

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

10034

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 52.00
\$
\$
\$
\$

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Jordanville, NY Herkimer

10288

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 52.00
\$
\$
\$
\$

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
St. Johnsville, NY Montgomery

10039

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ _____
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$ <u>52.00</u>
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ _____
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$ _____
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ _____

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer	\$ <u>1.00</u> per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
1+ Kilometers	\$ <u>0.25</u> per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

CITY / COUNTY
Skaneateles, NY Onondaga
10052

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ _____
\$ <u>52.00</u>
\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ _____

\$ <u>1.00</u> per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ <u>0.25</u> per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Ogdensburg, NY St. Lawrence
10134

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ _____
\$ <u>52.00</u>
\$ _____
\$ _____
\$ _____

\$ <u>1.00</u> per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ <u>0.25</u> per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Watertown, NY Jefferson
10133

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ 52.00
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ 80.00
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer	\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
1+ Kilometers	\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY / COUNTY
Honeoye Falls, NY Livingston
10053

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

TCH
sions)

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$
\$ 52.00
\$ 80.00
\$
\$

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Oaks Corners, NY Ontario
10054

CH
ions)

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$
\$ 52.00
\$
\$
\$

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
South Lansing, NY Tompkins
10067

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ 52.00
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ 80.00
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer	\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
1+ Kilometers	\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY / COUNTY
Stafford, NY Genesee
10289

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 52.00
\$
\$ 80.00
\$
\$

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Scottsville/Rochester Monroe
10087

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 52.00
\$
\$ 80.00
\$
\$

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Rochester, NY Monroe
10066

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Mornac Bros, Inc.

Bidder

Mornac Bros, Inc.

Bidder

GIERNATT ASPHALT
PRODUCTS, INC.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NB
\$ 52.50
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ 80.87

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ 80.87

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ N/B
\$ N/B
\$ 93.85
\$ N/B
\$ 93.85

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

1+ Kilometers

\$.28 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY / COUNTY

Clinton / Oneida

30201

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$.28 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Rte. 43 West Sand Lake / Rensselaer

\$ 1.70 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$.15 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

SPRINGVILLE ; ERIE CO.

10103

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

GROUP 31504 – BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
Dutchess Quarry & Supply
49 Arborio Rd. PO Box 651
Pleasant Valley, NY 12569

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ _____
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$ <u>46.250</u>
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ _____
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$ _____
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ _____

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

\$ 0.90 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$ 0.63 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Pleasant Valley, NY
10161, 10254

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

TCH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Morman Bros, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ 80.87

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$.28 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Albany / Albany
30103

TCH
sions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Morman Bros, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NB
\$ 52.50
\$ NB
\$ NB
\$ 80.87

\$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$.28 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Amsterdam / Montgomery
30203

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Cobleskill Stone Products, Inc.

Bidder

Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting Co., Inc.

Bidder

DOLomite Products Company, Inc

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NO BID
\$ NO BID
\$ NO BID
\$ 73.50
\$ NO BID

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NB
\$ 49.00
\$ NB
\$ 68.00
\$ NB

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ -
\$ -
\$ 104.50
\$ -
\$ -

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer
1+ Kilometers

\$1.40 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

\$1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.18 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

\$ 3.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY / COUNTY
Coblesill/Schoharie, Howes Cave/Schoharie
10177

CITY / COUNTY
Chemung, Chemung County, New York
10131

CITY / COUNTY
AS BELOW
10308

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

STOCKPILE LOCATION	COUNTY.
GATES	MONROE
PENFIELD	MONROE
WALWORTH	WAYNE
MANCHESTER	ONTARIO
AVON	LIVINGSTON
LEROY	GENESEE

(continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

<u>Spec. Item</u>	<u>Stockpile Patching Material Type</u>
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder

Chenango Concrete Corp

Chenango Asphalt Products

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ 66.95

\$ N.B

\$ N.B

\$ 74.45

\$

\$ 3.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$.40 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Norwich N.Y. Chenango

10181

TCH
ons)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Cobleskill Stone Products, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NO BID

\$ NO BID

\$ NO BID

\$ 78.00

\$ NO BID

\$ 1.40 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$.30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Prattsville/Green, Oneonta/Otsego
Hancock/Delaware
10177

TCH
ons)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Cobleskill Stone Products, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ NO BID

\$ NO BID

\$ NO BID

\$ 71.25

\$ NO BID

\$ 1.40 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

\$.30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Schoharie/Schoharie

10177

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder Colarusso Blacktop
A division of A Colarusso
& Son Inc.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ 55.00
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$ 55.00
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer	\$ 2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
1+ Kilometers	\$.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder
County Line Stone Co., Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 54.90
\$
\$ 76.75
\$
\$

\$ 1.75 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.24 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Town of Newstead, Erie County

10097,8,275

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 43.50
\$ 43.50
\$
\$
\$

\$.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.20 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Amsterdam NY Montgomery

10266

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Callanan Industries, Inc.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 55.75
\$ No Bid
\$ 82.75
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

\$.50	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.25	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY/COUNTY
Dream Lake Road, Washington County
10003 (Pattersonville)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder

Callanan Industries, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 58.00
\$ No Bid
\$ 82.75
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid

\$.50	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.25	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY/COUNTY
Bridgeville, Sullivan Road
Sullivan County
10147 (Port Ewen)

Bidder

Callanan Industries, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 49.75
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid

\$.50	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.25	per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY/COUNTY
Clockville, Ingalls Corners Road,
Madison County
10176, 10005

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder

Callanan Industries, Inc.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

<u>Spec. Item</u>	<u>Stockpile Patching Material Type</u>
15402.2010M	Plant Mix
15402.2020M	Cold Mix
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid
\$ 104.50
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

\$ 3.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$ 0.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Brockport Quarry, Monroe County
10308

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder

Callanan Industries, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ 53.75
\$ No Bid
\$ 80.75
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid

\$.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

East Kingston, Rt. 32, East Kingston
Ulster County
10147

Bidder

Callanan Industries, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

\$ 53.75
\$ No Bid
\$ 80.75
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid

\$.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Village of Wynantskill, 620 Main Av
Wynantskill, Rensselaer County
10003 (Pattersonville)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
Callanan Industries, Inc.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Item	Stockpile Patching Material Type	*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M	Plant Mix	\$ 53.75
15402.2020M	Cold Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2030M	Plant-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ 80.75
15402.2040M	Fiber Reinforced Mix	\$ No Bid
15402.2050M	Cold-Mixed Modified Mix	\$ No Bid

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)

0-1 kilometer	\$.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
1+ Kilometers	\$.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

CITY / COUNTY
Ravena, Rt. 9W, Albany County
10003 (Pattersonville)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

Bidder
Callanan Industries, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 53.75
\$ No Bid
\$ 80.75
\$ 67.25
\$ No Bid

\$.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Port Ewen, Salem Road, Ulster County
10147

Bidder
Callanan Industries, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant per Net Metric Ton
\$ 49.75
\$ No Bid
\$ 78.75
\$ No Bid
\$ No Bid

\$.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
\$.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 st Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Pattersonville, Rt. 5S, Pattersonvi
Montgomery County
10003