

Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER	21131
BID OPENING	8/9/2007
GROUP NUMBER	31503
PURCHASING OFFICER	Jose DeAndres
TELEPHONE	(518) 473-8572

DESCRIPTION

Bituminous Concrete, Hot Mix Asphalt
(DOT, Specific Project:VPP)
(2007 Second Letting Hot Mix Asphalt VPP) (Combined
State Funded and Federally Aided)

GROUP 31503 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE HOT MIX ASPHALT
 (Specific Project DOT: 2007 Second Letting Hot Mix Asphalt VPP)
 (Combined State Funded and Federally Aided)

SPHALT
 (ix Asphalt VPP)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
 PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
 INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒ ⇒

Bidder
 Cobleskill Stone Products, Inc.

Bidder
 American Paving & Excavating, Inc.
 5880 Thompson Road
 Clarence Center, NY 14032

BID PRICE TO INCLUDE OCP INSURANCE

Project Number	County/Location	Item	Est. Metric Tons	Tack Coat Est. Qty. Liters	OGS Item	Price Per Metric Ton/Liter	Total Price	NYS DOT Plant Number
5V071A	Cattaraugus Route 219 CR 75 to Erie Co Ln RM 219 5101/ 3168-3247 Towns of Ellicotville & Ashford 12.7 km	402.06720118M 407.0218M	10,080	40,500	1	\$ _____ \$ _____	\$ _____ \$ _____	_____
					1 GRAND TOTAL: \$ _____			
906503	Chenango County Route 12B Sherburne to Earlville Ref Mkr 12B 9201/ 1001-1039 Town of Sherburne 6.1km	402.097301M 402.018901M 702-90	5,100 2,350	25,900	2	\$65.00 \$65.00 \$.68	\$331,500 \$152,750 \$17,612.00	10181/10189 10181/10189
					2 GRAND TOTAL: \$501,862.00			
930707	Otsego County Route 7 Schenevus to Worcester Ref Mkr 7 9403/ 3141-3186 Towns of Worcester & Maryland 7.3 Km	402.096301M 702-90	6,500	6,830	3	\$67.00 \$1.45	\$435,500 \$9,903.50	10177
					3 GRAND TOTAL: \$445,403.50			
THE FOLLOWING PROJECT WILL BE 100% FEDERALLY FUNDED								
402047	Genesee Route 20 Tonawanda Creek to Rte 63 Ref Mkr 20 4103/ 1110 - 1206 Towns of Bethany, Alexander and Pavilion 15.4 km	402.06730118M 407.0218M	11,290	41,000	4	\$ _____ \$ _____	\$ _____ \$ _____	_____
					4 GRAND TOTAL: \$ _____			

y. OGS Item	Price Per Metric Ton/Liter	Total Price	NYS DOT Plant Number
1	\$79.00 \$1.00	\$796,320 \$40,500	10348 30702
1 GRAND TOTAL: \$836,820.00			
2			
2 GRAND TOTAL: \$ NO BID			
3			
3 GRAND TOTAL: \$ NO BID			
4	\$72.00 \$.98	\$812,880 \$40,180	10098 30702
4 GRAND TOTAL: \$853,060.00			

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
 PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
 INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
 => => => => =>

Bidder **HANSON AGGREGATES**
 P.O. Box 513
 Jamesville, NY 13078

BID PRICE TO INCLUDE OCP INSURANCE

Project Number	County/Location	Item	Est. Metric Tons	Tack Coat Est. Qty. Liters	OGS Item	Price Per Metric Ton/Liter	Total Price	NYS DOT Plant Number
5V071A	Cattaraugus Route 219 CR 75 to Erie Co Ln RM 219 5101/ 3168-3247 Towns of Ellicottville & Ashford 12.7 km	402.06720118M 407.0218M	10,080	40,500	1	_____	_____	_____
1 GRAND TOTAL:						\$ <u>No Bid</u>		
906503	Chenango County Route 12B Sherburne to Earlville Ref Mkr 12B 9201/ 1001-1039 Town of Sherburne 6.1km	402.097301M 402.018901M 702-90	5,100 2,350	25,900	2	\$ <u>62.91</u>	\$ <u>320,841.00</u>	
2 GRAND TOTAL:						\$ <u>473,947.50</u>		
930707	Otsego County Route 7 Schenevus to Worcester Ref Mkr 7 9403/ 3141-3186 Towns of Worcester & Maryland 7.3 Km	402.096301M 702-90	6,500	6,830	3	_____	_____	_____
3 GRAND TOTAL:						\$ <u>No Bid</u>		
402047	Genesee Route 20 Tonawanda Creek to Rte 63 Ref Mkr 20 4103/ 1110 - 1206 Towns of Bethany, Alexander and Pavilion 15.4 km	402.06730118M 407.0218M	11,290	41,000	4	\$ <u>63.88</u>	\$ <u>721,205.20</u>	
4 GRAND TOTAL:						\$ <u>743,755.20</u>		

THE FOLLOWING PROJECT WILL BE 100%
 FEDERALLY FUNDED

(continued)

Bidder **AMHERST PAVING, INC.**
 530 MEYER ROAD
 AMHERST, NEW YORK 14228

OGS Item	Price Per Metric Ton/Liter	Total Price	NYS DOT Plant Number
1	\$ <u>73.40</u>	\$ <u>739,872.00</u>	#10348
1 GRAND TOTAL: \$ _____			
2	\$ _____	\$ _____	
2 GRAND TOTAL: \$ _____			
3	\$ _____	\$ _____	
3 GRAND TOTAL: \$ _____			
4	\$ <u>63.30</u>	\$ <u>771,107.00</u>	#10275
4 GRAND TOTAL: \$ <u>809,642.00</u>			

Bidder **RAMSEY CONSTRUCTORS, INC.**
 5711 GATEWAY PARK
 LAKEVILLE, NY 14480

OGS Item	Price Per Metric Ton/Liter	Total Price	NYS DOT Plant Number
1	\$ _____	\$ _____	
1 GRAND TOTAL: \$ _____			
2	\$ _____	\$ _____	
2 GRAND TOTAL: \$ _____			
3	\$ _____	\$ _____	
3 GRAND TOTAL: \$ _____			
4	\$ <u>66.50</u>	\$ <u>750,785.00</u>	10289 & 10325
4 GRAND TOTAL: \$ <u>779,485.00</u>			

GROUP 31503 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE HOT MIX ASPHALT
 (Specific Project DOT: 2007 Second Letting Hot Mix Asphalt VPP)
 (Combined State Funded and Federally Aided)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
 PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
 INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX
 => => => => =>

Bidder
 Lancaster Development, Inc.

BID PRICE TO INCLUDE OCP INSURANCE

Project Number	County/Location	Item	Est. Metric Tons	Tack Coat Est. Qty. Liters	OGS Item	Price Per Metric Ton/Liter	Total Price	NYS DOT Plant Number
5V071A	Cattaraugus Route 219 CR 75 to Erie Co Ln RM 219 5101/ 3168-3247 Towns of Ellicottville & Ashford 12.7 km	402.06720118M 407.0218M	10,080	40,500	1	\$ _____	\$ _____	
1 GRAND TOTAL:						\$ <u>NO BID</u>		
906503	Chenango County Route 12B Sherburne to Earlville Ref Mkr 12B 9201/ 1001-1039 Town of Sherburne 6.1km	402.097301M 402.018901M 702-90	5,100 2,350	25,900	2	\$69.25 \$68.06 \$ 0.33	\$353,175.00 \$159,941.00 \$ 8,547.00	#3231 #3231
2 GRAND TOTAL:						\$ 521,663.00		
930707	Otsego County Route 7 Schenevus to Worcester Ref Mkr 7 9403/ 3141-3186 Towns of Worcester & Maryland 7.3 Km	402.096301M 702-90	6,500	6,830	3	\$ _____	\$ _____	
3 GRAND TOTAL:						\$ <u>NO BID</u>		
402047	Genesee Route 20 Tonawanda Creek to Rte 63 Ref Mkr 20 4103/ 1110 - 1206 Towns of Bethany, Alexander and Pavilion 15.4 km	402.06730118M 407.0218M	11,290	41,000	4	\$ _____	\$ _____	
4 GRAND TOTAL:						\$ <u>NO BID</u>		

**THE FOLLOWING PROJECT WILL BE 100%
 FEDERALLY FUNDED**

(continued)

**ASPHALT
 Mix Asphalt VPP)**

Bidder
 Keeler Construction Co., Inc.

Qty.	OGS Item	Price Per Metric Ton/Liter	Total Price	NYS DOT Plant Number
10	1	\$ _____	\$ _____	
1 GRAND TOTAL:				\$ _____
30	2	\$ _____	\$ _____	
2 GRAND TOTAL:				\$ _____
0	3	\$ _____	\$ _____	
3 GRAND TOTAL:				\$ _____
00	4	\$68.17 \$.98	\$769,639.30 \$ 40,180.00	10306 10306
4 GRAND TOTAL:				\$ 809,819.30

**ASPHALT
 Mix Asphalt VPP)**

Bidder
 MILHERST CONSTRUCTION INC

Qty.	OGS Item	Price Per Metric Ton/Liter	Total Price	NYS DOT Plant Number
10	1	\$78.85 \$ 1.00	\$794,808.00 \$ 40,500.00	1034B 30502
1 GRAND TOTAL:				\$ 835,308.00
0	2	\$ _____	\$ _____	
2 GRAND TOTAL:				\$ _____
0	3	\$ _____	\$ _____	
3 GRAND TOTAL:				\$ _____
00	4	\$74.85 \$ 1.00	\$845,056.50 \$ 41,000.00	10097 30502
4 GRAND TOTAL:				\$ 886,056.50

GROUP 31503 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE HOT MIX ASPHALT
(Specific Project DOT: 2007 Second Letting Hot Mix Asphalt VPP)
(Combined State Funded and Federally Aided)

PAGE 45

ASPHALT
Mix Asphalt VPP)

PAGE 45

ASPHALT
Mix Asphalt VPP)

PAGE 45

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

=> => => => => =>

Bidder
Keeler Construction Co., Inc.

Bidder
MILHERST CONSTRUCTION INC.

Bidder HANSON AGGREGATES
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

NOTES TO BIDDERS: FAILURE TO ANSWER THE
QUESTIONS WILL DELAY THE EVALUATION OF YOUR BID
AND MAY RESULT IN REJECTION OF YOUR BID.

- Are prices quoted the same as or lower than those quoted other corporations, institutions and government agencies (including GSA/VA contracts) on similar products, quantities, terms and conditions? See "Best Pricing Offer" in Appendix B, OGS General Specifications. If "NO", please explain on a separate sheet.
- Do you have a contract with the General Services Administration (GSA) or Veterans Affairs (VA) for products offered? (Check all that apply.)
If yes, will you offer New York State pricing equal to or better than your GSA or VA pricing?
- Does bidder offer Electronic Access Ordering (EDI)?

YES NO

GSA VA NO

GSA VA NO

YES NO

YES NO

GSA VA NO

GSA VA NO

YES NO

YES NO

GSA VA NO

GSA VA NO

YES NO

- Plant(s) that may be used by bidder:
(Please see "QUALIFICATION OF BIDDER" clause.)

"Short" OGS Item	"Short" Plant Number	Column - "Wide" Plant Location
402	10306	Albion, NY
407	10306	Albion, NY

"Short" OGS Item	"Short" Plant Number	Column - "Wide" Plant Location
SV071A	10097	County Line Stone
402047	10348	Delevan - Gernatt

"Short" OGS Item	"Short" Plant Number	Column - "Wide" Plant Location
2	10038	Oriskany Falls, NY
4	10085	Stafford, NY

(continued)