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PS69669

23246-Administrative Services

NEW YORK STATE

BIDDER PRICING DOCUMENT - 
ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES

73003-23246

Category Administrative Services
Company Name: Talent4health, LLC
Contact Name: Joshua Johnston, President
Phone Number: (201) 549-2576

Address: PO Box 372, 

City, State, Zip: Jersey City, NJ 07303
E-Mail: sales@talent4health.com 

 STANDARD INITIAL CHECKS 

TYPE OF BACKGROUND CHECK
 MAXIMUM NOT TO 
EXCEED RATE PER 

BACKGROUND CHECK 
NATIONAL CRIMINAL BACKGROUND 

CHECK  $                                  108.45 

STATE & COUNTY CRIMINAL HISTORY  $                                    54.23 
SEXUAL OFFENDER REGISTRY QUERY  $                                    10.85 

EMPLOYMENT VERIFICATION  $                                    10.85 
EDUCATIONAL BACKGROUND 

VERIFICATION  $                                    10.85 

SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER 
VERIFICATION  $                                    10.85 

DEPARTMENT OF MOTOR VEHICLES 
CHECK  $                                    10.85 

BACKGROUND CHECK FEES
ALL FEES ARE NOT TO EXCEED RATES

mailto:sales@talent4health.com
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ALL BID PRICING MUST BE MAXIMUM-NOT-TO-EXCEED PRICING
COUNTIES IN REGION 1: Albany, Columbia, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 
set forth in the RFQ by 
the Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

6 1 General Health Occupations Audiologists Hour $108.45 $135.56 $135.56
6 1 General Health Occupations Dietitians & Nutritionist Hour $81.34 $101.67 $101.67
6 1 General Health Occupations Home Health Aides Hour $32.54 $40.67 $40.67
6 1 General Health Occupations Medical and Clinical Laboratory Technicians Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 1 General Health Occupations Mental Health & Substance Abuse Social worker Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 1 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 1 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 1 General Health Occupations Pharmacist Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 1 General Health Occupations Physical Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 1 General Health Occupations Physical Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 1 General Health Occupations Speech-Language Pathologists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01

COUNTIES IN REGION 2: Cayuga, Cortland, Madison, Onondaga and Oswego

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 
set forth in the RFQ by 
the Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

6 2 General Health Occupations Audiologists Hour $108.45 $135.56 $135.56
6 2 General Health Occupations Dietitians & Nutritionist Hour $81.34 $101.67 $101.67
6 2 General Health Occupations Home Health Aides Hour $32.54 $40.67 $40.67
6 2 General Health Occupations Medical and Clinical Laboratory Technicians Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 2 General Health Occupations Mental Health & Substance Abuse Social worker Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 2 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56



Talent4Health, LLC
PS69669

23246-Administrative Services

6 2 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 2 General Health Occupations Pharmacist Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 2 General Health Occupations Physical Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 2 General Health Occupations Physical Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 2 General Health Occupations Speech-Language Pathologists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01

COUNTIES IN REGION 3: Genesee, Livingston, Monroe, Ontario, Orleans, Seneca, Wayne, Wyoming and Yates

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 
set forth in the RFQ by 
the Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

6 3 General Health Occupations Audiologists Hour $108.45 $135.56 $135.56
6 3 General Health Occupations Dietitians & Nutritionist Hour $81.34 $101.67 $101.67
6 3 General Health Occupations Home Health Aides Hour $32.54 $40.67 $40.67
6 3 General Health Occupations Medical and Clinical Laboratory Technicians Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 3 General Health Occupations Mental Health & Substance Abuse Social worker Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 3 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 3 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 3 General Health Occupations Pharmacist Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 3 General Health Occupations Physical Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 3 General Health Occupations Physical Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 3 General Health Occupations Speech-Language Pathologists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01

COUNTIES IN REGION 4: Dutchess, Orange, Putnam, Rockland, Sullivan, Ulster and Westchester

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 
set forth in the RFQ by 
the Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate
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6 4 General Health Occupations Audiologists Hour $108.45 $135.56 $135.56
6 4 General Health Occupations Dietitians & Nutritionist Hour $81.34 $101.67 $101.67
6 4 General Health Occupations Home Health Aides Hour $32.54 $40.67 $40.67
6 4 General Health Occupations Medical and Clinical Laboratory Technicians Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 4 General Health Occupations Mental Health & Substance Abuse Social worker Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 4 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 4 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 4 General Health Occupations Pharmacist Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 4 General Health Occupations Physical Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 4 General Health Occupations Physical Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 4 General Health Occupations Speech-Language Pathologists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01

COUNTIES IN REGION 5: Nassau and Suffolk 

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 
set forth in the RFQ by 
the Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

6 5 General Health Occupations Audiologists Hour $108.45 $135.56 $135.56
6 5 General Health Occupations Dietitians & Nutritionist Hour $81.34 $101.67 $101.67
6 5 General Health Occupations Home Health Aides Hour $32.54 $40.67 $40.67
6 5 General Health Occupations Medical and Clinical Laboratory Technicians Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 5 General Health Occupations Mental Health & Substance Abuse Social worker Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 5 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 5 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 5 General Health Occupations Pharmacist Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 5 General Health Occupations Physical Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 5 General Health Occupations Physical Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 5 General Health Occupations Speech-Language Pathologists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01

COUNTIES IN REGION 6: Fulton, Herkimer, Montgomery, Oneida, Otsego and Schoharie
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LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 
set forth in the RFQ by 
the Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

6 6 General Health Occupations Audiologists Hour $108.45 $135.56 $135.56
6 6 General Health Occupations Dietitians & Nutritionist Hour $81.34 $101.67 $101.67
6 6 General Health Occupations Home Health Aides Hour $32.54 $40.67 $40.67
6 6 General Health Occupations Medical and Clinical Laboratory Technicians Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 6 General Health Occupations Mental Health & Substance Abuse Social worker Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 6 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 6 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 6 General Health Occupations Pharmacist Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 6 General Health Occupations Physical Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 6 General Health Occupations Physical Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 6 General Health Occupations Speech-Language Pathologists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01

COUNTIES IN REGION 7: Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens and Richmond

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 
set forth in the RFQ by 
the Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

6 7 General Health Occupations Audiologists Hour $130.14 $162.68 $162.68
6 7 General Health Occupations Dietitians & Nutritionist Hour $103.03 $128.78 $128.78
6 7 General Health Occupations Home Health Aides Hour $43.38 $54.23 $54.23
6 7 General Health Occupations Medical and Clinical Laboratory Technicians Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 7 General Health Occupations Mental Health & Substance Abuse Social worker Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 7 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapist Assistants Hour $70.49 $88.12 $88.12
6 7 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapists Hour $113.87 $142.34 $142.34
6 7 General Health Occupations Pharmacist Hour $135.56 $169.45 $169.45
6 7 General Health Occupations Physical Therapist Assistants Hour $70.49 $88.12 $88.12
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6 7 General Health Occupations Physical Therapists Hour $113.87 $142.34 $142.34
6 7 General Health Occupations Speech-Language Pathologists Hour $113.87 $142.34 $142.34

COUNTIES IN REGION 8: Clinton, Essex, Franklin, Hamilton, Jefferson, Lewis and St. Lawrence

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 
set forth in the RFQ by 
the Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

6 8 General Health Occupations Audiologists Hour $108.45 $135.56 $135.56
6 8 General Health Occupations Dietitians & Nutritionist Hour $81.34 $101.67 $101.67
6 8 General Health Occupations Home Health Aides Hour $32.54 $40.67 $40.67
6 8 General Health Occupations Medical and Clinical Laboratory Technicians Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 8 General Health Occupations Mental Health & Substance Abuse Social worker Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 8 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 8 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 8 General Health Occupations Pharmacist Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 8 General Health Occupations Physical Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 8 General Health Occupations Physical Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 8 General Health Occupations Speech-Language Pathologists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01

COUNTIES IN REGION 9: Broome, Chemung, Chenango, Delaware, Schuyler, Steuben, Tioga and Tompkins

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 
set forth in the RFQ by 
the Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

6 9 General Health Occupations Audiologists Hour $108.45 $135.56 $135.56
6 9 General Health Occupations Dietitians & Nutritionist Hour $81.34 $101.67 $101.67
6 9 General Health Occupations Home Health Aides Hour $32.54 $40.67 $40.67
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6 9 General Health Occupations Medical and Clinical Laboratory Technicians Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 9 General Health Occupations Mental Health & Substance Abuse Social worker Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 9 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 9 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 9 General Health Occupations Pharmacist Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 9 General Health Occupations Physical Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 9 General Health Occupations Physical Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 9 General Health Occupations Speech-Language Pathologists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01

COUNTIES IN REGION 10: Allegany, Cattaraugus, Chautaugua, Erie and Niagara

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 
set forth in the RFQ by 
the Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

6 10 General Health Occupations Audiologists Hour $108.45 $135.56 $135.56
6 10 General Health Occupations Dietitians & Nutritionist Hour $81.34 $101.67 $101.67
6 10 General Health Occupations Home Health Aides Hour $32.54 $40.67 $40.67
6 10 General Health Occupations Medical and Clinical Laboratory Technicians Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 10 General Health Occupations Mental Health & Substance Abuse Social worker Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 10 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 10 General Health Occupations Occupational Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 10 General Health Occupations Pharmacist Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
6 10 General Health Occupations Physical Therapist Assistants Hour $59.65 $74.56 $74.56
6 10 General Health Occupations Physical Therapists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
6 10 General Health Occupations Speech-Language Pathologists Hour $97.61 $122.01 $122.01
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ALL BID PRICING MUST BE MAXIMUM-NOT-TO-EXCEED PRICING
COUNTIES IN REGION 1: Albany, Columbia, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 

set forth in the RFQ by the 
Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

7 1 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $189.79 $237.23 $237.23
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $151.83 $189.79 $189.79
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $162.68 $203.34 $203.34
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $54.23 $67.78 $67.78
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $173.52 $216.90 $216.90

COUNTIES IN REGION 2: Cayuga, Cortland, Madison, Onondaga and Oswego

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 

set forth in the RFQ by the 
Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

7 2 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $189.79 $237.23 $237.23
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $151.83 $189.79 $189.79
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $162.68 $203.34 $203.34
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $54.23 $67.78 $67.78
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $173.52 $216.90 $216.90
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COUNTIES IN REGION 3: Genesee, Livingston, Monroe, Ontario, Orleans, Seneca, Wayne, Wyoming and Yates

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 

set forth in the RFQ by the 
Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

7 3 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $189.79 $237.23 $237.23
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $151.83 $189.79 $189.79
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $162.68 $203.34 $203.34
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $54.23 $67.78 $67.78
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $173.52 $216.90 $216.90

COUNTIES IN REGION 4: Dutchess, Orange, Putnam, Rockland, Sullivan, Ulster and Westchester

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 

set forth in the RFQ by the 
Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

7 4 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $189.79 $237.23 $237.23
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $151.83 $189.79 $189.79
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $162.68 $203.34 $203.34
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $54.23 $67.78 $67.78
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $173.52 $216.90 $216.90

COUNTIES IN REGION 5: Nassau and Suffolk 
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LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 

set forth in the RFQ by the 
Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

7 5 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $189.79 $237.23 $237.23
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $151.83 $189.79 $189.79
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $162.68 $203.34 $203.34
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $54.23 $67.78 $67.78
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $173.52 $216.90 $216.90

COUNTIES IN REGION 6: Fulton, Herkimer, Montgomery, Oneida, Otsego and Schoharie

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 

set forth in the RFQ by the 
Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

7 6 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $189.79 $237.23 $237.23
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $151.83 $189.79 $189.79
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $162.68 $203.34 $203.34
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $54.23 $67.78 $67.78
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $173.52 $216.90 $216.90

COUNTIES IN REGION 7: Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens and Richmond
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LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 

set forth in the RFQ by the 
Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

7 7 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $206.06 $257.57 $257.57
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $135.56 $169.45 $169.45
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $173.52 $216.90 $216.90
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $184.37 $230.46 $230.46
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $65.07 $81.34 $81.34
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $195.21 $244.01 $244.01

COUNTIES IN REGION 8: Clinton, Essex, Franklin, Hamilton, Jefferson, Lewis and St. Lawrence

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 

set forth in the RFQ by the 
Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

7 8 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $189.79 $237.23 $237.23
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $151.83 $189.79 $189.79
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $162.68 $203.34 $203.34
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $54.23 $67.78 $67.78
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $173.52 $216.90 $216.90

COUNTIES IN REGION 9: Broome, Chemung, Chenango, Delaware, Schuyler, Steuben, Tioga and Tompkins
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LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 

set forth in the RFQ by the 
Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

7 9 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $189.79 $237.23 $237.23
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $151.83 $189.79 $189.79
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $162.68 $203.34 $203.34
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $54.23 $67.78 $67.78
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $173.52 $216.90 $216.90

COUNTIES IN REGION 10: Allegany, Cattaraugus, Chautaugua, Erie and Niagara

LOT 
NUMBER

REGION 
NUMBER

JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate 
(which may include any 
additional requirements 

set forth in the RFQ by the 
Authorized User)

Not-to-Exceed Overtime 
Rate 

Not-to Exceed NYS 
Holiday Rate

7 10 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $189.79 $237.23 $237.23
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $119.30 $149.12 $149.12
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $151.83 $189.79 $189.79
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $162.68 $203.34 $203.34
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $54.23 $67.78 $67.78
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $173.52 $216.90 $216.90
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