White Glove Placement, Inc. PS69678 #23246 - Administrative Services

NEW YORK STATE

BIDDER PRICING DOCUMENT - ADMINISTRATIVE

SERVICES
73003-23246
Category Administrative Services
Company Name: WHITE GLOVE PLACEMENT, INC.
Contact Name: COLLEEN VAN HORNE, MS, RN
Phone Number: 718-387-8163 EXT.108
Address: 89 BARTLETT STREET
City, State, Zip: BROOKLYN, NY 11206
E-Mail: CVANHORNE@WHITEGLOVECARE.NET
BACKGROUND CHECK FEES

ALL FEES ARE NOT TO EXCEED RATES

STANDARD INITIAL CHECKS

MAXIMUM NOT TO EXCEED RATE PER
BACKGROUND CHECK

TYPE OF BACKGROUND CHECK

NATIONAL CRIMINAL BACKGROUND $21.69
CHECK I
STATE & COUNTY CRIMINAL HISTORY $143.15
SEXUAL OFFENDER REGISTRY QUERY $14.10
EMPLOYMENT VERIFICATION $48.80
EDUCATIONAL BACKGROUND $56.39
VERIFICATION I
SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER $9.76
VERIFICATION I
DEPARTMENT OF MOTOR VEHICLES
CHECK $23.86




White Glove Placement, Inc. PS69678

ALL BID PRICING MUST BE MAXIMUM-NOT-TO-EXCEED PRICING

COUNTIES IN REGION 1: Albany, Columbia, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate

(which may include any . "
Lot REGION UNIT OF Not-to-Exceed Overtime Not-to Exceed NYS Holida
JOB CATEGORY JOBTITLE additional requirements X vert! X 'day
NUMBER NUMBER MEASURE . Rate Rate
set forth in the RFQ by the

Authorized User)

7 1 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $215.82 $323.72 $323.72
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $107.37 $161.05 $161.05
7 1 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40

COUNTIES IN REGION 2: Cayuga, Cortland, Madison, Onondaga and Oswego

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate

(which may include any ) N
LOT REGION UNIT OF . R Not-to-Exceed Overtime Not-to Exceed NYS Holiday
JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE additional requirements
NUMBER NUMBER MEASURE . Rate Rate
set forth in the RFQ by the

Authorized User)

7 2 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $215.82 $323.72 $323.72
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $107.37 $161.05 $161.05
7 2 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40

COUNTIES IN REGION 3: Genesee, Livingston, Monroe, Ontario, Orleans, Seneca, Wayne, Wyoming and Yates

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate

(which may include any . "

Lot REGION UNIT OF Not-to-Exceed Overtime Not-to Exceed NYS Holida
JOB CATEGORY JOBTITLE additional requirements X vert! X 'day

NUMBER NUMBER MEASURE . Rate Rate

set forth in the RFQ by the

Authorized User)

7 3 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $215.82 $323.72 $323.72
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $107.37 $161.05 $161.05
7 3 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40

COUNTIES IN REGION 4: Dutchess, Orange, Putnam, Rockland, Sullivan, Ulster and Westchester
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Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate
(which may include any

LoT REGION UNIT OF Not-to-E: d O i - i
JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE additional requirements ot-to-Exceed Overtime  Not-to Exceed NYS Holiday

MBER  NUMBER MEASURE . Rate Rate
set forth in the RFQ by the

Authorized User)

7 4 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $215.82 $323.72 $323.72
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $107.37 $161.05 $161.05
7 4 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40

COUNTIES IN REGION 5: Nassau and Suffolk

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate

which may include an
LoT REGION UNIT OF { L v . Y Not-to-Exceed Overtime Not-to Exceed NYS Holiday
JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE additional requirements
MBER  NUMBER MEASURE . Rate Rate
set forth in the RFQ by the

Authorized User)

7 5 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $215.82 $323.72 $323.72
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $107.37 $161.05 $161.05
7 5 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40

COUNTIES IN REGION 6: Fulton, Herkimer, Montgomery, Oneida, Otsego and Schoharie

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate

which may include an
LOT REGION UNIT OF ( . v R Y Not-to-Exceed Overtime Not-to Exceed NYS Holiday
JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE additional requirements
NUMBER NUMBER MEASURE . Rate Rate
set forth in the RFQ by the

Authorized User)

7 6 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $215.82 $323.72 $323.72
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $107.37 $161.05 $161.05
7 6 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40

COUNTIES IN REGION 7: Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens and Richmond

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate

which may include an
LoT REGION UNIT OF { L v . Y Not-to-Exceed Overtime Not-to Exceed NYS Holiday
JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE additional requirements
NUMBER NUMBER MEASURE . Rate Rate
set forth in the RFQ by the

Authorized User)

Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners
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7 7 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $215.82 $323.72 $323.72
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $107.37 $161.05 $161.05
7 7 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40

COUNTIES IN REGION 8: Clinton, Essex, Franklin, Hamilton, Jefferson, Lewis and St. Lawrence

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate

which may include an

LOT REGION UNIT OF ( v R Y Not-to-Exceed Overtime Not-to Exceed NYS Holiday
JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE additional requirements

NUMBER NUMBER MEASURE . Rate Rate

set forth in the RFQ by the

Authorized User)

7 8 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $215.82 $323.72 $323.72
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $107.37 $161.05 $161.05
7 8 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40

COUNTIES IN REGION 9: Broome, Chemung, Chenango, Delaware, Schuyler, Steuben, Tioga and Tompkins

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate

which may include an
LoT REGION UNIT OF { L v . Y Not-to-Exceed Overtime Not-to Exceed NYS Holiday
JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE additional requirements
MBER  NUMBER MEASURE . Rate Rate
set forth in the RFQ by the

Authorized User)

7 9 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $215.82 $323.72 $323.72
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $107.37 $161.05 $161.05
7 9 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40

COUNTIES IN REGION 10: Allegany, Cattaraugus, Chautaugua, Erie and Niagara

Not-to-Exceed Bill Rate
(which may include any ) N
LoT REGION UNIT OF Not-to-E: d Overti -
JOB CATEGORY JOB TITLE additional requirements ot-to-Exceed Overtime  Not-to Exceed NYS Holiday

NUMBER NUMBER MEASURE . Rate Rate
set forth in the RFQ by the

Authorized User)

7 10 Physicians and Nurses Family and General Practitioners Hour NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Nurse Practitioner Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Licensed Practical and Licensed Vocational Hour $215.82 $323.72 $323.72
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Nurses, Registered Bi-Lingual Spanish/English Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Nursing Aides, Orderlies, and Attendants Hour $107.37 $161.05 $161.05
7 10 Physicians and Nurses Physician Assistants Hour $324.27 $486.40 $486.40
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