Group 05600 Award 23344

Notes:

GASOLINE & E-85 PRICES

Publication Date =

Start Date =
End Date =

Group 05600

Award 23344
3/17/2025
3/14/2025
3/20/2025

1) All prices are taken from the OPIS Weekly Published Newsletter published on Mondays.
2) All prices are per gallon.
3) The volume discount applies to deliveries 5,500 gallons or greater.

Gasoline Pricing Valid From: 3/14/2025 Through 3/20/2025
County Fuel Type Current Price Volume Discount Vendor Contract
Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.4703 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Albany Gasoline Regular $2.0718 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Premium $2.3258 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Allegany Gasoline Regular $2.3883 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.5133 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
[ Bronx | OPRG(E) Regular $2.2200 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574 |
Broome Gasoline Regular $2.0718 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.1758 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Cattaraugus Gasoline Regular $2.1203 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC70573
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.2773 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC70573
[ Cayuga [ Gasoline Regular $2.2308 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
[ Chautaugqua | Gasoline Regular $2.1203 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC70573 |
Chemung Gasoline Regular $2.1738 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Premium $2.4053 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
[ Chenango I Gasoline Regular $2.1653 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
Clinton Gasoline Regular $2.3608 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC70572
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.4548 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC70572
[ Columbia [ Gasoline Regular $2.1301 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
Cortland Gasoline Regular $2.2108 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Premium $2.5033 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
[ Delaware [ Gasoline Regular $2.2173 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
OPRG(E) Regular $2.2090 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Dutchess OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.2885 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
OPRG(E) Premium $2.4976 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Gasoline Regular $2.0557 $0.0150 NOCO Energy PC70573
Erie Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.3043 $0.0150 NOCO Energy PC70573
Gasoline Premium $2.4453 $0.0150 NOCO Energy PC70573
Essex Gasoline Regular $2.3608 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC70572
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.4548 $0.1000 MX Petroleum PC70572
Franklin Gasoline Regular $2.2140 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
Gasoline Premium $2.9227 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
[ Fulton I Gasoline Regular $2.0893 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
[ Genesee [ Gasoline Regular $2.1003 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC70573 |
Greene Gasoline Regular $2.2336 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Gasoline Premium $2.3399 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Herkimer Gasoline Regular $2.1183 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Premium $2.4508 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Jefferson Gasoline Regular $2.2858 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Premium $2.5808 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Kings OPRG(E) Regular $2.1421 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
OPRG(E) Premium $2.4195 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
[ Lewis [ Gasoline Regular $2.2383 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
Livingston Gasoline Regular $2.1258 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC70570
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.3248 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC70570
Madison Gasoline Regular $2.1083 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.2348 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Monroe Gasoline Regular $2.0883 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC70573
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.2143 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC70573
Gasoline Premium $2.3553 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC70573
Montgomery Gasoline Regular $2.0533 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
OPRG(E) Regular $1.9738 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
Nassau OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.1124 $0.0000 Sprague Operating ~ PC70574
OPRG(E) Premium $2.2512 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
New York OPRG(E) Regular $2.5761 $0.0000 Global Montello  PC70569
OPRG(E) Premium $2.8618 $0.0000 Global Montello  PC70569
Gasoline Regular $2.0883 $0.0125 NOCO Energy PC70573
Niagara Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.2973 $0.0125 NOCO Energy PC70573
Gasoline Premium $2.4383 $0.0125 NOCO Energy PC70573
Oneida Gasoline Regular $2.0368 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Mid-Grade $1.8648 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
[ Onondaga [ Gasoline Regular $2.1108 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
Gasoline Regular $2.2183 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
Ontario Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.3233 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
Gasoline Premium $2.4708 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.4703 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Orange OPRG(E) Regular $2.2109 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.2904 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
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Group 05600 Award 23344

Gasoline Pricing Valid From: 3/14/2025 Through 3/20/2025
| OPRG(E) Premium $2.4995 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569 |
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Orleans Gasoline Regular $2.0757 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC70573
Gasoline Premium $2.3757 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC70573
Oswego Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Gasoline Regular $2.1808 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
[ Otsego [ Gasoline Regular $2.1533 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
OPRG(E) Regular $2.1861 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Putnam OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.2655 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
OPRG(E) Premium $2.4747 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
OPRG(E) Regular $2.0821 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
Queens OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.2208 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
OPRG(E) Premium $2.3596 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
Rensselaer Gasoline Regular $2.1140 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.1775 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
[ Richmond [ OPRG(E) Regular $2.5761 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569 |
OPRG(E) Regular $2.2232 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Rockland OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.3026 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
OPRG(E) Premium $2.5117 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Gasoline Regular $2.1358 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Saratoga Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.2358 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Premium $2.4108 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Schenectady Ga;oling Regular $2.1238 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.2273 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
[ Schoharie [ Gasoline Regular $2.1406 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
| Schuyler | Gasoline Regular $2.3353 $0.0000 NOCO Energy PC70573 ]
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
Seneca Gasoline Regular $2.1903 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.3848 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Premium $2.5758 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A No Award
St. Lawrence Gasoline Regular $2.3383 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.4833 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
Steuben Gasoline Regular $2.3183 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.4333 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571
OPRG(E) Regular $1.9707 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
Suffolk OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.1093 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
OPRG(E) Premium $2.2481 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
Sullivan Gasoline Regular $2.1925 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Gasoline Premium $2.3488 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
[ Tioga I Gasoline Regular $2.3033 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
[ Tompkins I Gasoline Regular $2.1478 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568 |
Gasoline Regular $2.1738 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Ulster Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.2222 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Gasoline Premium $2.2801 $0.0000 Global Montello PC70569
Warren Gasoline Regular $2.1458 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.3048 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Regular $2.1698 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Washington Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.2948 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Premium $2.6233 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Wayne Gasoline Regular $2.1823 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.3333 $0.0000 Buell Fuel PC70568
OPRG(E) Regular $2.0689 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
Westchester OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.2075 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
OPRG(E) Premium $2.3463 $0.0000 Sprague Operating PC70574
[ Wyoming [ Gasoline Regular $2.1978 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel __PC70570 |
[ Yates I Gasoline Regular $2.3183 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy PC70571 |

Notes:

GASOLINE PRICE CALCULATIONS

1) All prices are taken from the OPIS Weekly Published Newsletter published on Mondays.

2) Al prices are per gallon.

3) The volume discount applies to deliveries 5,500 gallons or greater.

Current Gasoline Regular

Current Gasoline Mid-Grade

Current Gasoline Premium

Current OPRG(E) Regular

Reg Unl =
Base Price =
Adjustment =

Mid Unl =
Base Price =
Adjustment =

Pre Unl =
Base Price =
Adjustment =

RBOB =
Ethanol =
Current Price =
Base Price =

$1.9408 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
$2.4575 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
-$0.5167 dollars per gallon

$2.0348 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
$2.6825 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
-$0.6477 dollars per gallon

$2.1758 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
$3.0200 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
-$0.8442 dollars per gallon

$1.8748 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, NY Harbor Barge
$1.7778 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, NY Spot Market Price
$1.8650 dollars per gallon

$2.4104 dollars per gallon
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Gasoline Pricing Valid From:

Current OPRG(E) Mid-Grade
Average of RBOB & PreRBOB =

Current OPRG(E) Premium

Current Flex Fuel (E-85)

3/14/2025 Through

-$0.5454 dollars per gallon

$2.0173 dollars per gallon
$1.7778 dollars per gallon
$1.9932 dollars per gallon
$2.5260 dollars per gallon
-$0.5328 dollars per gallon

$2.1598 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, NY Harbor Barge
$1.7778 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, NY Spot Market Price

$2.1215 dollars per gallon
$2.6417 dollars per gallon
-$0.5202 dollars per gallon

$1.9408 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, Linden
$1.7778 dollars per gallon, Weekly Averages Spot Report, NY Spot Market Price

$1.8022 dollars per gallon
$2.0011 dollars per gallon
-$0.1989 dollars per gallon

Gasoline and E-85

3/20/2025
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Gasoline Pricing Valid From: 3/14/2025 Through

Notes:

1) All prices are taken from the OPIS Weekly Published Newsletter published on Mondays.
2) All prices are per gallon.

3) The volume discount applies to deliveries 5,500 gallons or greater.

Gas Price by Contractor

Vendor Contract County Fuel Type
Global Montello PC70569 Albany Flex Fuel (E-85)
Buell Fuel PC70568 Albany Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Albany Gasoline Premium
Mirabito Energy PC70571 Allegany Gasoline Regular
Mirabito Energy PC70571 Allegany Gasoline Mid-Grade
Sprague Operating PC70574 Bronx OPRG(E) Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Broome Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Broome Gasoline Mid-Grade
NOCO Energy PC70573 Cattaraugus Gasoline Regular
NOCO Energy PC70573 Cattaraugus Gasoline Mid-Grade
Buell Fuel PC70568 Cayuga Gasoline Regular
NOCO Energy PC70573 Chautauqua Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Chemung Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Chemung Gasoline Premium
Buell Fuel PC70568 Chenango Gasoline Regular
MX Petroleum PC70572 Clinton Gasoline Regular
MX Petroleum PC70572 Clinton Gasoline Mid-Grade
Buell Fuel PC70568 Columbia Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Cortland Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Cortland Gasoline Premium
Buell Fuel PC70568 Delaware Gasoline Regular
Global Montello PC70569 Dutchess OPRG(E) Regular
Global Montello PC70569 Dutchess OPRG(E) Mid-Grade
Global Montello PC70569 Dutchess OPRG(E) Premium
NOCO Energy PC70573 Erie Gasoline Regular
NOCO Energy PC70573 Erie Gasoline Mid-Grade
NOCO Energy PC70573 Erie Gasoline Premium
MX Petroleum PC70572 Essex Gasoline Regular
MX Petroleum PC70572 Essex Gasoline Mid-Grade
Mirabito Energy PC70571 Franklin Gasoline Regular
Mirabito Energy PC70571 Franklin Gasoline Premium
Buell Fuel PC70568 Fulton Gasoline Regular
NOCO Energy PC70573 Genesee Gasoline Regular
Global Montello PC70569 Greene Gasoline Regular
Global Montello PC70569 Greene Gasoline Premium
Buell Fuel PC70568 Herkimer Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Herkimer Gasoline Premium
Buell Fuel PC70568 Jefferson Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Jefferson Gasoline Premium
Sprague Operating PC70574 Kings OPRG(E) Regular
Sprague Operating PC70574 Kings OPRG(E) Premium
Buell Fuel PC70568 Lewis Gasoline Regular
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC70570 Livingston Gasoline Regular
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel PC70570 Livingston Gasoline Mid-Grade
Buell Fuel PC70568 Madison Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Madison Gasoline Mid-Grade
N/A No Award Monroe Flex Fuel (E-85)
NOCO Energy PC70573 Monroe Gasoline Regular
NOCO Energy PC70573 Monroe Gasoline Mid-Grade
NOCO Energy PC70573 Monroe Gasoline Premium
Buell Fuel PC70568 Montgomery Gasoline Regular
Sprague Operating PC70574 Nassau OPRG(E) Regular
Sprague Operating PC70574 Nassau OPRG(E) Mid-Grade
Sprague Operating PC70574 Nassau OPRG(E) Premium
Global Montello PC70569 New York OPRG(E) Regular
Global Montello PC70569 New York OPRG(E) Premium
NOCO Energy PC70573 Niagara Gasoline Regular
NOCO Energy PC70573 Niagara Gasoline Mid-Grade
NOCO Energy PC70573 Niagara Gasoline Premium
Buell Fuel PC70568 Oneida Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Oneida Gasoline Mid-Grade
Buell Fuel PC70568 Onondaga Gasoline Regular
Mirabito Energy PC70571 Ontario Gasoline Regular
Mirabito Energy PC70571 Ontario Gasoline Mid-Grade
Mirabito Energy PC70571 Ontario Gasoline Premium
Global Montello PC70569 Orange Flex Fuel (E-85)
Global Montello PC70569 Orange OPRG(E) Regular
Global Montello PC70569 Orange OPRG(E) Mid-Grade
Global Montello PC70569 Orange OPRG(E) Premium
N/A No Award Orleans Flex Fuel (E-85)
NOCO Energy PC70573 Orleans Gasoline Regular
NOCO Energy PC70573 Orleans Gasoline Premium
N/A No Award Oswego Flex Fuel (E-85)
Buell Fuel PC70568 Oswego Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Otsego Gasoline Regular
Global Montello PC70569 Putnam OPRG(E) Regular
Global Montello PC70569 Putnam OPRG(E) Mid-Grade
Global Montello PC70569 Putnam OPRG(E) Premium
Sprague Operating PC70574 Queens OPRG(E) Regular
Sprague Operating PC70574 Queens OPRG(E) Mid-Grade
Sprague Operating PC70574 Queens OPRG(E) Premium
Mirabito Energy PC70571 Rensselaer Gasoline Regular
Mirabito Energy PC70571 Rensselaer Gasoline Mid-Grade
Global Montello PC70569 Richmond OPRG(E) Regular
Global Montello PC70569 Rockland OPRG(E) Regular
Global Montello PC70569 Rockland OPRG(E) Mid-Grade
Global Montello PC70569 Rockland OPRG(E) Premium
Buell Fuel PC70568 Saratoga Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Saratoga Gasoline Mid-Grade
Buell Fuel PC70568 Saratoga Gasoline Premium
Buell Fuel PC70568 Schenectady Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Schenectady Gasoline Mid-Grade
Buell Fuel PC70568 Schoharie Gasoline Regular
NOCO Energy PC70573 Schuyler Gasoline Regular
N/A No Award Seneca Flex Fuel (E-85)
Buell Fuel PC70568 Seneca Gasoline Regular
Buell Fuel PC70568 Seneca Gasoline Mid-Grade
Buell Fuel PC70568 Seneca Gasoline Premium
N/A No Award St. Lawrence Flex Fuel (E-85)
Mirabito Energy PC70571 St. Lawrence Gasoline Regular

Group 05600 Award 23344 Gasoline and E-85

3/20/2025

Current Price

$2.4703
$2.0718
$2.3258
$2.3883
$2.5133
$2.2200
$2.0718
$2.1758
$2.1203
$2.2773
$2.2308
$2.1203
$2.1738
$2.4053
$2.1653
$2.3608
$2.4548
$2.1301
$2.2108
$2.5033
$2.2173
$2.2090
$2.2885
$2.4976
$2.0557
$2.3043
$2.4453
$2.3608
$2.4548
$2.2140
$2.9227
$2.0893
$2.1003
$2.2336
$2.3399
$2.1183
$2.4508
$2.2858
$2.5808
$2.1421
$2.4195
$2.2383
$2.1258
$2.3248
$2.1083
$2.2348
No Bid
$2.0883
$2.2143
$2.3553
$2.0533
$1.9738
$2.1124
$2.2512
$2.5761
$2.8618
$2.0883
$2.2973
$2.4383
$2.0368
$1.8648
$2.1108
$2.2183
$2.3233
$2.4708
$2.4703
$2.2109
$2.2904
$2.4995
No Bid
$2.0757
$2.3757
No Bid
$2.1808
$2.1533
$2.1861
$2.2655
$2.4747
$2.0821
$2.2208
$2.3596
$2.1140
$2.1775
$2.5761
$2.2232
$2.3026
$2.5117
$2.1358
$2.2358
$2.4108
$2.1238
$2.2273
$2.1406
$2.3353
No Bid
$2.1903
$2.3848
$2.5758
No Bid
$2.3383

Volume

Discount

$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.1000
$0.1000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0150
$0.0150
$0.0150
$0.1000
$0.1000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
N/A
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0125
$0.0125
$0.0125
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
N/A
$0.0000
$0.0000
N/A
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
N/A
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
N/A
$0.0000

Bid Price

$2.6692
$2.5885
$3.1700
$2.9050
$3.1610
$2.7654
$2.5885
$2.8235
$2.6370
$2.9250
$2.7475
$2.6370
$2.6905
$3.2495
$2.6820
$2.8775
$3.1025
$2.6468
$2.7275
$3.3475
$2.7340
$2.7544
$2.8213
$3.0178
$2.5724
$2.9520
$3.2895
$2.8775
$3.1025
$2.7307
$3.7669
$2.6060
$2.6170
$2.7503
$3.1841
$2.6350
$3.2950
$2.8025
$3.4250
$2.6875
$2.9397
$2.7550
$2.6425
$2.9725
$2.6250
$2.8825
No Bid
$2.6050
$2.8620
$3.1995
$2.5700
$2.5192
$2.6452
$2.7714
$3.1215
$3.3820
$2.6050
$2.9450
$3.2825
$2.5535
$2.5125
$2.6275
$2.7350
$2.9710
$3.3150
$2.6692
$2.7563
$2.8232
$3.0197
No Bid
$2.5924
$3.2199
No Bid
$2.6975
$2.6700
$2.7315
$2.7983
$2.9949
$2.6275
$2.7536
$2.8798
$2.6307
$2.8252
$3.1215
$2.7686
$2.8354
$3.0319
$2.6525
$2.8835
$3.2550
$2.6405
$2.8750
$2.6573
$2.8520
No Bid
$2.7070
$3.0325
$3.4200
No Bid
$2.8550

Page 4

Revised 3/17/2025



Group 05600 Award 23344

Gasoline Pricing Valid From:

Mirabito Energy
Mirabito Energy
Mirabito Energy
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Global Montello
Global Montello
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Global Montello
Global Montello
Global Montello
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Buell Fuel
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Sprague Operating
Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Mirabito Energy

PC70571
PC70571
PC70571
PC70574
PC70574
PC70574
PC70569
PC70569
PC70568
PC70568
PC70569
PC70569
PC70569
PC70568
PC70568
PC70568
PC70568
PC70568
PC70568
PC70568
PC70574
PC70574
PC70574
PC70570
PC70571

3/14/2025

St. Lawrence
Steuben
Steuben
Suffolk
Suffolk
Suffolk
Sullivan
Sullivan
Tioga
Tompkins
Ulster

Ulster

Ulster
Warren
Warren
Washington
Washington
Washington
Wayne
Wayne
Westchester
Westchester
Westchester
Wyoming
Yates

Through

Gasoline Mid-Grade
Gasoline Regular
Gasoline Mid-Grade
OPRG(E) Regular
OPRG(E) Mid-Grade
OPRG(E) Premium
Gasoline Regular
Gasoline Premium
Gasoline Regular
Gasoline Regular
Gasoline Regular
Gasoline Mid-Grade
Gasoline Premium
Gasoline Regular
Gasoline Mid-Grade
Gasoline Regular
Gasoline Mid-Grade
Gasoline Premium
Gasoline Regular
Gasoline Mid-Grade
OPRG(E) Regular
OPRG(E) Mid-Grade
OPRG(E) Premium
Gasoline Regular
Gasoline Regular

Gasoline and E-85

3/20/2025

$2.4833
$2.3183
$2.4333
$1.9707
$2.1093
$2.2481
$2.1925
$2.3488
$2.3033
$2.1478
$2.1738
$2.2222
$2.2801
$2.1458
$2.3048
$2.1698
$2.2948
$2.6233
$2.1823
$2.3333
$2.0689
$2.2075
$2.3463
$2.1978
$2.3183

$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000

$3.1310
$2.8350
$3.0810
$2.5161
$2.6421
$2.7683
$2.7092
$3.1930
$2.8200
$2.6645
$2.6905
$2.8699
$3.1243
$2.6625
$2.9525
$2.6865
$2.9425
$3.4675
$2.6990
$2.9810
$2.6143
$2.7403
$2.8665
$2.7145
$2.8350
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